
SPEAKER BIOGRAPHIES

La Cole Archuletta

Brittani Jordan, A Long Walk Home, Inc. Girl/Friends alumna

Jennifer Adams, North County Women's Shelter and Resource Center/ Sexual Assault 
Response and Prevention Center of San Luis Obispo

LEAH ALDRIDGE 
As Associate Director of Youth Violence Prevention, Policy and Training for Peace Over 
Violence (formerly the Los Angeles Commission on Assaults Against Women), Ms. 
Aldridge supervised the development, implementation and direction of violence 
prevention programs for youth, their families and community. Her responsibilities 
included the recruitment and training staff and volunteers; organizational development 
and management; working in coalition and collaboration with allied organizations and 
individuals; and the continuous development of strategies to better serve youth. 
Through her extensive work with teens came POV’s In Touch With Teens Curriculum, 
which was recognized nationally as a model program for dating/sexual violence 
prevention education for youth. Currently Ms. Aldridge is a PhD Candidate at the 
University of Southern California, School of Cinematic Arts, Division of Critical Studies. 
Her research interests center on how international distribution and circulation impacts 
domestic production

MARIA ALTONEN
Maria Altonen, is a Project Coordinator at the Virginia Sexual and Domestic Violence 
Action Alliance and Virginia Anti Violence Project. In Their current role, coordinates a 
Richmond metropolitan area project which enhances intimate partner violence and 
sexual abuse services to the LGBTQ community. Maria also has extensive experience 
working on the Virginia statewide hotline for sexual and domestic violence through the 
Action Alliance. Maria has a Bachelors degree in Social Justice from George Mason 
University. As well as a Masters in Urban Planning with a concentration in Housing 
Policy, and graduate certificate in Gender Violence and Intervention from Virginia 
Commonwealth University.

CORDELIA ANDERSON
Since 1976, Cordelia Anderson, M.A., has been working for to end child sexual abuse. 
Cordelia has nearly 35 years of experience in prevention - promoting healthy 
development and preventing harmful behaviors. She is an advocate for primary 
prevention and social change. During the last 20 years through her own training and 
consultation business Cordelia has worked with a wide variety of organizations 
nationwide to help them advance their prevention strategies and has conducted over 
2,200 presentations nationally and internationally throughout her career. Together with 
Joan Tanbachnick, Cordelia is a lead presenter for the PreventConnect/Ms. Foundation 
for Women Ending Child Sexual Abuse web conference series.



EMILY AUSTIN
Emily Austin is the Director of Policy and Evaluation at Peace Over Violence, a non-
profit domestic violence and sexual assault intervention and prevention organization. A 
native of Northern California, Ms. Austin graduated from the University of California, Los  
Angeles with a BA in Women’s Studies and English. She received her law degree from 
the University of Southern California. Upon graduating law school, Emily was an Audrey 
and Sydney Irmas Fellow at the California Women’s Law Center. Her fellowship focused 
on teen dating violence and the educational system’s response to teen dating violence, 
sexual assault, and sexual harassment. During law school, Emily was a judicial extern 
to the Honorable Steven Reinhardt on the 9th Circuit Court of Appeals. She also clerked 
for two civil rights law firms and held an internship with the California Women’s Law 
Center. Emily has worked on women’s issues for seven years as both a women’s 
studies major and law student. Emily provided direct services to women and children at 
the USC Law Domestic Violence Clinic as a certified law student. She participated in the 
Philip C. Jessup International Law Moot Court Competition and has worked on 
international women’s rights, civil rights and police misconduct cases. She is an active 
alumni of the Public Interest Law Foundation. Since joining Peace Over Violence, Emily 
has helped publish the second edition of In Touch With Teens: A Relationship Violence 
Prevention Curriculum and co-authored Be Strong: From the Inside Out. She also has 
helped organize four Peace Over Violence’s Violence-Free Teens: Building Healthy 
Relationships Conferences. She has co-authored several policy and research papers 
for Peace Over Violence, including A Painful Truth: A Retrospective of a Decade of 
Sexual Violence, and Stories of Strength: Report on Child Sexual Abuse & Community 
Recommendations for Prevention.

CLAUDIA J. BAYLIFF
Claudia J. Bayliff is an attorney and educator with twenty-five years of experience 
working on issues related to sexual assault. She is currently serving as the National 
Judicial Education Program’s (NJEP) Project Attorney, developing judicial educational 
materials and educating judges nationwide about sexual assault. She has a broad 
range of experience on the issue of sexual violence, from volunteering as a hotline crisis  
counselor to serving as the first Chief of the United States Air Force’s worldwide Sexual 
Assault Prevention and Response Program. She has also consulted with the 
Department of the Navy, the Navy, the Marine Corps and the Army to help them develop 
their sexual assault prevention and investigation strategies. Ms. Bayliff served as the 
Assistant Director of the Boulder County Rape Crisis Team. She also taught classes on 
women and the law at the University of Colorado in Boulder and Denver. Ms. Bayliff is a 
nationally recognized expert on sexual violence. She has extensive experience in policy 
analysis and development, research, and curriculum development for civilian, military 
and tribal communities. She has also presented at conferences and professional 
organizations throughout the United States, Canada and Europe about sexual violence 
and the intersection of sexual and domestic violence.



KRIS BEIN
Kris Bein is the Assistant Coordinator for the Resource Sharing Project, where she 
provides training and technical assistance to state coalitions and rural rape crisis 
centers on sexual assault services, agency structure, and capacity building. Ms. Bein 
has been a part of the anti-violence movement since 1995. Ms. Bein holds a master’s 
degree in Human Services, specialization in Social Services Administration, from the 
University of Illinois.

ALISON BELLAVANCE
Alison Bellavance, M.Ed., CSE is the Director of Education for Planned Parenthood of 
Northeast, Mid-Penn and Bucks County. With over 10 years experience in sexuality 
education, Alison has expertise in the intersection between healthy sexuality and sexual 
violence prevention and has provided consultation on the National Sexual Violence 
Resource Center’s 2012 & 2013 SAAM campaigns. She has worked with many sexual 
violence prevention organizations and Planned Parenthood affiliates to increase 
collaboration and strengthen sexual violence prevention efforts. Alison is also an 
Adjunct Instructor at the Center for Human Sexuality Studies at Widener University.

ALAN BERKOWITZ
Alan Berkowitz is a recognized leader in the sexual assault prevention field, including 
the design of prevention programs for men, implementation of the social norms 
approach as a violence prevention strategy, and bystander intervention training and 
skills. He has published extensively on sexual assault prevention and the design of 
prevention programs for men, and has received five national awards for his work as a 
prevention specialist. He has been an invited speaker at previous NSVRC conferences 
and was on the planning committee for the first three CDC sponsored national violence 
prevention conferences. In addition, he is a frequent keynote speaker at State Coalition 
of Sexual Assault Annual Meetings and consults extensively with public health agencies, 
the military, and higher education to develop and implement state of the art sexual 
assault prevention programs.

GERRY D. BLASINGAME
Gerry D. Blasingame, Psy.D., is a California licensed marriage and family therapist. For 
the last twenty-eight years he has worked with adults and adolescents, with and without 
developmental disabilities, who have sexually offended, and with victims of abuse and 
sexual assault. Gerry has authored several articles, chapters, and books including 
Developmentally Disabled Persons with Sexual Behavior Problems, second edition 
(2005) and An Introduction to Autism Spectrum Disorders, Sexual Behaviors, and 
Therapeutic Interventions (2011). Gerry is a current member of ATSA (Association for 
the Treatment of Sexual Abusers), and a past member of the ATSA Board as the Pacific 
Region Representative. Gerry is also past Chairperson of the Board of Directors for the 
California Coalition on Sexual Offending. Gerry was appointed to the California Sex 
Offender Management Board (CASOMB) in 2007, and is the chairperson of the 
CASOMB Treatment Committee. Gerry provides training and consultation services for 



several institutions, residential programs and community based programs and clinicians 
regarding adults and adolescents. Gerry has presented at numerous conferences as 
well. Gerry enjoys hiking and nature photography in his spare time.

MOLLY BOEDER HARRIS
 was launched into the field of sexual violence and healing trauma as a volunteer, 
professional and activist after surviving being sexually assaulted in 2003. Exploring 
many diverse traditional and non-traditional resources for recovery and resilience in the 
aftermath of the assault, she found that the approaches which integrated the physical, 
emotional, energetic, and spiritual impacts of sexual trauma proved to be the most 
effective and most empowering. Molly has worked in community-based rape crisis 
centers as a crisis intervention medical and legal advocate and has provided crisis 
intervention support and prevention education for students on a college campus — yet 
she feels most drawn to and inspired by the work to connect survivors to support 
systems that facilitate sustainable healing and embodiment after trauma. She is 
humbled by witnessing survivors of all demographics and from all continents explore 
and experience their unique and innate capacity to heal and transcend the trauma of 
sexual violence. She holds a Master’s Degree in International Studies and a Master’s 
Certificate in Women’s and Gender Studies. Molly is also a Certified Yoga instructor 
offering public classes, private instruction as well as workshops specifically focused on 
healing trauma through yoga.

HALLIE BONGAR WHITE
Hallie Bongar White, JD, is the Executive Director of the Southwest Center on Law and 
Policy (SWCLAP). SWCLAP is the legal training and technical assistance provider for 
the Office on Violence Against Women, United States Department of Justice for all tribal 
grantees and is the parent organization of the National Tribal Trial College, the National 
Indian Country Clearinghouse on Sexual Assault, and SAFESTAR. Ms. White is the 
author of numerous publications related to sexual violence against American Indian/
Alaska Native women including the national tribal law enforcement and prosecution 
protocols on sexual assault and SAFESTAR, She serves on the U.S. Department of 
Justice, Office for Victims of Crime National Coordination Committee on the American 
Indian/Alaska Native Sexual Assault Nurse Examiner-Sexual Assault Response Team 
Initiative.Ms. White resides with her husband and children (Citizen Potawatomi Nation) 
in Tucson, Arizona.

JOE BOOTH
Joe Booth, Just Detention International Survivor Council Member

MEG BOSSONG
Meg Bossong is the Manager of Community Engagement for the Boston Area Rape 
Crisis Center. In that role, she manages the community-facing education and outreach 
work of Massachusetts’ oldest and largest rape crisis center, which serves 26 cities and 
towns and 1.3 million people in the Greater Boston area. Over the last five years with 
BARCC, her work has included collaboration with a variety of community partners in 
education, health care, faith communities, law enforcement, and municipal government 



to coordinate sexual violence prevention and intervention initiatives. As an independent 
consultant, she works with colleges to design sexual violence response and prevention 
policies and programming initiatives and to train campus stakeholders on issues related 
to sexual violence. She holds a B.A. in political science from Williams with a 
concentration in comparative social change and an M.S. in Law and Public Policy from 
Northeastern University with a focus in interdisciplinary approaches to violence 
prevention.

ABIGAIL BOYER
Abigail Boyer is the Director of Communications and Outreach for the Clery Center for 
Security On Campus. Abigail graduated from West Chester University with a degree in 
Political Science. Prior to working for the Clery Center, Abigail was the Community 
Outreach Coordinator for the Prevention/Education department of The Crime Victims’ 
Center of Chester County, Inc, whose mission is to support and empower victims of 
crime while increasing awareness of violence and its impact on victims and the 
community. Abigail has a passion for victim advocacy and is pleased to use her 
background in victims' services while coordinating the organization's communications 
strategy.

CONDENCIA BRADE
Condencia Brade is the co-founder and Executive Director for the National Organization 
of Sisters of Color Ending Sexual Assault (SCESA). SCESA is a Women of Color-led 
nonprofit dedicated to working with our communities to create a just society in which 
Women of Color are able to live healthy lives free of violence. As a national advocacy 
organization, SCESA utilizes a multi-strategy approach of leadership enhancement and 
support for Women of Color; advocacy and support for organizations by and for 
Communities of Color; as well as technical assistance, training and systems advocacy 
regarding sexual assault in Communities of Color. Condencia has a strong history 
working on issues related to Communities of Color and other marginalized communities, 
Children, Teens, and College Students. Prior to founding SCESA, Condencia worked at 
a statewide sexual assault coalition where she was instrumental in the creation and 
responsible for the management of a statewide Spanish Hotline, created a statewide 
Campus Consortium; a Youth group to address sexual assault; and a statewide team on 
Rural issues. She was also responsible for the provision of trainings for sexual assault 
crisis centers, law enforcement and healthcare providers addressing sexual assault. 
She has focused on issues such as leadership, immigration, economics, and health. 
She has also provided training and served on national committees to address systemic 
responses to sexual assault victims.

TED BUNCH
Ted Bunch is the Co-founder of A CALL TO MEN. He is recognized both nationally and 
internationally for his expertise in organizing and educating men in the effort to end 
violence against women. He is dedicated to strengthening community accountability to 
end all forms of violence against women. Ted is formerly the Senior Director and Co-
creator of the largest program for domestic violence offenders in America. Ted has 
worked with Police and Fire Departments, Emergency Medical Technicians, Paramedics 



and other first responders to domestic violence. Ted has served as a consultant to The 
White House Commission on Violence Against Women and Girls, the Department of 
Justice Office of Violence Against Women. He is a recognized trainer, lecturer and 
consultant on male accountability. A committed ally for more than a dozen years, Ted 
has gained leadership status in the domestic violence, rape and sexual assault 
prevention communities across the country. Ted brings a great enthusiasm and a wealth 
of knowledge to his work. He has trained at many colleges and universities throughout 
the United States as well as the National Football League. In addition, he has had guest 
appearances on numerous television and radio programs and has been a script 
consultant for Law & Order: Special Victims Unit. He has traveled abroad speaking in 
places like Israel, Suriname, South Africa, Ghana, Brasil and Puerto Rico as well as 
being an invited guest presenter for the United Nations' Commission on the Status of 
Women and the UN Alliance of Civilizations. Ted is an international lecturer for the U.S. 
State Department and was appointed by UN Secretary General Ban Ki- moon as a 
Committee Member to UNiTE, an international network of male leaders working to end 
violence against women.

MARÍA DEL CARMEN CABRERA APONTE
María del Carmen Cabrera Aponte, M.A. graduated Magna Cum Laude in 2001 from a 
Bachelor in Arts in Psychology of the University of Puerto Rico, Ponce Campus. Her 
major is in Social/Community Psychology. Cabrera worked six years as a research 
assistant in a project named "Encounter between genders". The main focus of the 
research was sexual behavior of gay couples towards HIV prevention. As part of the 
research project duties Cabrera had to travel to international conferences in Perú, 
Guatemala, Argentina and the Dominican Republic. She also was a presenter at the 
Bankog International HIV Congress in Tailand, 2004. In 2005 Cabrera received a 
scholarship to finish her master' s dissertation named "Coming out: Gay Men in PR". 
She has also worked on research on public policy and psychology. As part of her duties 
she supervised 15 students. In 2006 she worked on a research study on Asma in Puerto 
Rico at the Institute of Behavioral Sciences of the Medical Sciences Campus. In 2007 
she graduated Cum Laude of a Masters in Psychology. In 2008, she begun working at 
the Rape Victims Support Center at the Department of Health. She has published 
several articles in professional journals such as: (2009). Gender and women sexuality . 
(2008). Teach to teach: challenge for Education (2008). Psychologist and legislature: 
Promising relationship. (2008). Social-community Psychology and public policy Since 
2008 Cabrera is a professor at the Social Sciences Faculty, the University of Puerto 
Rico. That same year she was awarded with a prize from the CIES/UPR for her work " 
New teaching strategies: challenges to High School Education".

DAISY CACERES
Daisy Caceres was born and raised in Los Angeles, California. Ms. Caceres is a 
graduate of the University of California at Santa Barbara with a double major in 
Sociology and Chicano Studies. Since August 2011, she serves as the Crisis 
Intervention Coordinator with the Santa Barbara Rape Crisis Center and is a Certified 
Sexual Assault Counselor. During Ms. Caceres’s time at the center she has had the 
opportunity to participate in additional trainings: Suicide Prevention, Institutional 



Advocacy, CA Victim Advocate Training in Human Trafficking of Minors, as well as an 
extensive training for Long Term Counseling.

RACHEL CAIDOR
Rachel Caidor, Associate Director, Campus Advocacy Network at the University of 
Illinois at Chicago (UIC).

LIZ CASCONE
Liz Cascone, MSW, is the Advocacy Manager at the Virginia Sexual and Domestic 
Violence Action Alliance. In her current role she coordinates programming and advocacy 
efforts related to primary prevention, public policy, data collection, and resource 
development. Liz has extensive experience in sexual and intimate partner violence 
primary prevention planning and program development. This experience is rooted in 
sound public health and social justice principles. Liz has experience developing 
prevention campaigns and strategies, such as The Red Flag Campaign and DoYou 
Campaign, and using social marketing techniques to reach various audiences. 
Previously, Liz worked at the local level for six years. She began her work doing 
community education in rural Virginia for a sexual and domestic violence program and 
after three years held the position of Program Director. Liz received her Masters of 
Social Work from Virginia Commonwealth University in 2000.

CYMANTHA
Cymantha is a senior at Camelback High School. They are the Senior Class Vice 
President in Camelback's Student Government and have been actively involved in 
STAND & SERVE for over a year. Cymantha is an after school peer educator at Machan 
K-8 school, volunteers regularly in their community and is assisting with developing and 
implementing S&S evaluation tools for students and families. Cymantha is deeply 
committed to cultivating SAFETY, EQUALITY AND RESPECT as norms to prevent the 
underlying conditions of sexual violence including oppression, silence/denial and 
normalized harm.

CRISTIAN CASTRO
Cristian Castro is an 18 year old Mexican college student studying to be an elementary 
school teacher. He has been a member of STAND & SERVE for four years, a youth 
organization educating on primary prevention of violence in all its forms. Cristian is also 
an advocate against misogyny and oppressive norms.

ELI CHEVALIER
Eli Chevalier is a STAND & SERVE Peer Educator and a Junior and GSA President at 
Tempe High school in Tempe, Arizona. For the past five years, Eli has been very active 
learning about and working to prevent sexual violence before it begins including 
facilitating workshops with sexual violence prevention and treatment providers across 
the state and speaking at conferences and events. Eli speaks about gender identity and 
LGBTQ activism related topics. Eli's expertise covers Primary Prevention, Trans* 
identities, how to be inclusive of new identities, proper terminology, different queer 
theories and use of pronouns making sure to highlight statistics and resources. Eli is 



deeply committed to cultivating safety,equality and respect (SER) as norms to prevent 
the underlying conditions of sexual violence including oppression, silence/denial and 
normalized (OSN) harm. Eli believes understanding and promoting respect for all 
identities on individual and societal levels is critical to effective primary prevention 
programming. Eli hosted March 2013's STAND & SERVE Day at the Capitol, is a peer 
educator Tuesdays and Wednesdays after school and during the summer, develops and 
updates curriculum and volunteers regularly in the community. Eli also is an actor and 
plays and writes music. 

JACOB CHEVALIER
Jacob Chevalier is a junior at Bio Science High School in Phoenix Arizona. He joined 
STAND & SERVE (S&S) five years ago and now serves as the STAND & SERVE 
Coalition Co-Chair, Peer Solutions Board Member and Peer Educator. Jacob develops, 
implements, evaluates and helps sustain year round primary prevention activities to 
prevent sexual violence before it begins. Jacob is deeply committed to cultivating 
SAFETY, EQUALITY & RESPECT (SER) as norms to prevent the underlying conditions 
of harm including OPPRESSION, SILENCE/DENIAL & NORMALIZED (OSN) harm. To 
internalize SER as norms to end OSN, Jacob has led the coalition in developing a new 
initiative entitled THE GUTS TO BE GOOD (G2BG), an initiative that emphasizes five 
things we can all do to make this world a better place. 1. The guts to be Respectful, 2. 
The guts to be Courteous, 3. The guts to Speak-Up, 4. The guts to be Honest and 5. 
The guts to Lend a Hand. Jacob hosts Bi-Annual STAND & SERVE Days at the Capitol, 
including the October Arizona Summit chosen by HHS and Joe Biden's Office to treat 
and prevent IPV. He is a peer educator on Mondays after school, volunteers regularly 
and is the solution.

MAIA CHRISTOPHER
Maia Christopher is currently the Executive Director of the Association for the Treatment 
of Sexual Abusers (ATSA). Ms. Christopher has 18 years’ experience providing 
treatment services to individuals who have offended. She has worked with Correctional 
Services of Canada and Washington State Department of Corrections. Ms. Christopher 
has presented extensively in the areas of practice guidelines of sex offender treatment, 
collaborating with community stakeholders invested in successful offender reintegration 
and policy pertaining to sexual offending. Ms. Christopher has held the position of 
Executive Director of ATSA for six years. ATSA is an international organization 
dedicated to the prevention of sexual abuse. ATSA promotes evidence based practice, 
public policy and community strategies that lead to the effective assessment, treatment 
and management of individuals who have sexually abused or are at risk to abuse.

CRISTY CHUNG
Cristy Chung is currently the Program and Operations Manager at Asian & Pacific 
Islander Institute on Domestic Violence. She has over twenty-five years of experience 
working in the anti-violence movement. Cristy began this work at UCSC in the Women’s 
Studies and Sociology departments. Cristy joined the staff at the Asian Women’s Shelter 
in San Francisco in the first year the shelter opened. During her 10 years there Cristy 
started their volunteer program, founded their Queer Asian Women’s program, lead their 



Multi-lingual Access Model program, and helped the shelter find a permanent home. In 
recent years Cristy has focused her social justice and social change work on community 
mobilization and school climate change in the education system that engages the entire 
community – educators, administrators, parents/care givers, students and local 
community members. Cristy has worked extensively in the fields of diversity and anti-
bias education, school climate change, cross-cultural service delivery, domestic violence 
intervention and prevention, and LGBT inclusive curriculum building. She is an 
experienced leader, trainer, facilitator, writer and community organizer. She is proudly 
the parent of 3 teenage girls that inform her work on a daily basis and make her 
question everything she has ever learned about parenting. She is currently interested in 
conversations about working at the intersections of race, gender and sexuality and ways 
to build our work across fields. Cristy is committed to finding creative solutions that offer 
us innovative opportunities to build and sustain the changes we desire. For fun she 
loves traveling and going on new adventures with the love of her life and their 3 girls

TRACY COX
Tracy Cox is the Communications Director at the National Sexual Violence Resource 
Center (NSVRC). Her job encompasses leading the Communications Department, 
creating NSVRC publications and working with members of the media to convey timely 
information about sexual violence prevention. Before joining the NSVRC in 2010, Cox’s 
career focused on print media and graphic design.

LINDA CROCKETT
For more than a decade, she was an award-winning designer/copy editor at 
newspapers including The Tuscaloosa News, The Atlanta Journal-Constitution and The 
Patriot-News. She has attended The Poynter Institute in 2003 and most recently, in 
2012 for a McCormick Specialized Reporting Institute on child sexual abuse. She 
worked with Poynter’s NewsU create a free, online course for journalists called 
Reporting on Sexual Violence.

YESENIA CURIEL
Yesenia Curiel is a native of Los Angeles and identifies as a Chicana, Feminist and 
Vegan. She relocated to Santa Barbara about 12 years ago, holds a MA in Clinical 
Psychology. She has over 13 years in the Sexual Assault field. Yesenia is the Program 
Director at Santa Barbara Rape Crisis Center (SBRCC) and has been involved with the 
organization since 2001. She has experience as an agency advocate covering its 24-
hour hotline to over five years experience in management. She has worked with men 
survivors, youth and monolingual Spanish speaking sexual assault survivors. She has 
developed curriculum for prevention groups targeting Latino youth to tailoring 
curriculum's for monolingual Spanish speaking women support groups. Her community 
involvement includes work with marginalized youth to addressing various forms of 
oppressions, political consciousness, human rights and mental health issues. Yesenia 
has been involved with the following community organizations: City of Santa Barbara 
Community Development & Human Services Committee as the Latina/o representative, 
serving as a board member of the Santa Barbara Women’s Political Committee and 
being a board member on California Coalition Against Sexual Assault (CALCASA).



MORGAN J. CURTIS
For the last decade, Morgan has worked to address issues of violence against women, 
through a variety of community, academic and organizational roles. Her specialty is 
building the capacity of organizations to conduct comprehensive, community-based 
primary prevention initiatives. The primary areas in which Morgan focuses her capacity 
building efforts are program planning/evaluation, organizational integration of 
prevention, and the intersection of social justice issues and violence prevention. Morgan 
started work at TAASA in 2006 as an intern while she was finishing her master's degree 
in social work and also working at the Institute on Domestic Violence and Sexual 
Assault. Since 2008, she has served as TAASA’s Director of Prevention Programs. In 
this role, she provides direction and leadership to all of the agency's statewide 
prevention efforts, including coordination of the statewide Primary Prevention Planning 
Committee. She also served on the leadership team for Project Connect, a statewide 
initiative exploring the intersections between primary health care and violence 
prevention. Additionally, Morgan serves as an adjunct lecturer at the University of Texas 
at Austin School of Social Work and also teaches yoga to individuals and groups in 
Austin.

KIM DAWKINS
Kim Dawkins, Executive Director, Pathways for Change

LINDA C. DEGUTIS
Dr. Degutis is Director of the National Center for Injury Prevention and Control at the 
Centers for Disease Control and Prevention (CDC) in Atlanta, Georgia, USA. Previously, 
she was Associate Professor of Emergency Medicine and Public Health at Yale 
University, serving as Research Director for the Department of Emergency Medicine, 
and Director of the Yale Center for Public Health Preparedness at the Yale School of 
Public Health. In addition, she directed the Connecticut Center for Public Health 
Workforce Development. A native of Chicago, Illinois, Dr. Degutis received her BS from 
DePaul University, and MSN and DrPH from Yale. As a Robert Wood Johnson 
Foundation Health Policy Fellow she worked in the office of the late Senator Paul 
Wellstone (D-MN). Dr. Degutis’ research and practice interests have focused on injury 
and violence, alcohol and other drug problems, and trauma, with a particular interest in 
policy issues. She has also collaborated on projects related to developing a research 
agenda for public health systems and services research, and initiatives in the area of 
quality improvement in public health. She was President of the American Public Health 
Association, a member of the APHA Executive Board, serving two terms as its chair. 
She co-chaired the Connecticut Coalition to Stop Underage Drinking, and was involved 
in a number of community-based efforts focused on improving public health through 
coalition development and action. Dr. Degutis serves on the Robert Wood Johnson 
Health Policy Fellowship Advisory Board, and the editorial board of the journal Injury 
Prevention.



ALLISION DEVITO
Captain Allison DeVito is Chief of the Victim Issues and Policy Branch, Military Justice 
Division, Air Force Legal Operations Agency, Joint Base Andrews, MD. In this capacity, 
Capt DeVito develops and implements programs and policies concerning victim related 
issues including the Special Victims’ Counsel Program; oversees the Air Force’s Victim 
and Witness Assistance Program; and coordinates with other divisions within the Air 
Staff and the JAG Corps to implement victim services programs.

PUJA DHAWAN
Puja Dhawan, Senior Manager, NoVo Foundation’s Initiatives for Girls and Women

DIANE DOCIS
Diane Docis previously served as the Deputy Staff Judge Advocate at Rome Laboratory 
and the Chief of Justice at Luke Air Force Base. She received a direct commission as 
an Air Force judge advocate in July 2008 and entered active duty in August 2008. Prior 
to entering the Air Force, she served as a law clerk at the International Criminal Tribunal 
for the former Yugoslavia and as a Legislative Assistant to Congresswoman Betty 
Sutton. She is admitted to practice law before the Court of Appeals of the State of New 
York, the Air Force Court of Criminal Appeals, and the United States Court of Appeals 
for the Armed Forces.

EDGAR DORMITORIO
Edgar Dormitorio, Director, Student Conduct,UC Irvine

DOROTHY J. EDWARDS
Dr. Dorothy J. Edwards, author of the Green Dot Violence Prevention Strategy, holds a 
Ph.D. in Counseling Psychology from Texas Woman’s University. Prior to her current 
position, serving as the Executive Director of Green Dot, etc., a center dedicated to 
effective intervention and prevention of power-based personal violence, Dr. Edwards 
served for five years as the founding Director of the University of Kentucky Violence 
Intervention and Prevention Center. She has worked in both counseling and teaching 
capacities in higher education. With a specialty in primary prevention, she provides 
training and consultation in the areas of power-based personal violence, organizational 
capacity building, program implementation, strategic planning and community 
mobilization. Dr. Edwards is currently working with government entities, state coalitions, 
military, non-profits, community organizations, elementary, middle and high schools, and 
colleges from around the globe.

RANDY ELLISON
Randy Ellison. Author of the book Boys Don’t Tell: Ending the Silence of Abuse, Ellison 
is a child sexual abuse victim’s advocate and an activist promoting cultural change 
working with local, state and national organizations. He addresses abuse prevention 
and healing for survivors from a survivor’s perspective. Ellison is a member Child Abuse 
Network of Southern Oregon, and the Oregon Attorney General’s Sexual Assault Task 
Force. He is a founding member and former board president of OAASIS, Oregon Abuse 
Advocates and Survivors in Service.



LISA ERICKSON
Lisa Erickson is a meditation instructor and energy worker specializing in women’s 
energetics – the unique attributes of women’s subtle body systems. 'Subtle body' is the 
term used within energy healing traditions to describe the anatomy of energy centers 
and flows upon which those traditions are based. Examples include yoga, reiki, and 
acupuncture. Lisa primarily works with chakra, or energy center, traditions, based in the 
yoga and healing traditions of India and Tibet. Lisa is a certified mindfulness meditation 
instructor, certified hatha yoga instructor, and graduate of internationally acclaimed 
author and energy healer Cyndi Dale's 2-year energy healer training program. She has 
been meditating daily herself for 25 years, and has been teaching meditation and 
energy work for 12 years. She developed women's energetics workshop, and sexual 
abuse and trauma recovery workshops, upon request from students in her classes, and 
eventually took these online. Her popular women's spirituality blog 
(www.MommyMystic.com) offers a free E-book on healing the subtle body wounds of 
sexual trauma, and she also offers sliding scale private sessions to survivors of sexual 
abuse and trauma. She has worked with hundreds of women through these means in 
the last 5 years, and is a practitioner in The Breathe Network, an organization dedicated 
to helping survivors of sexual assault find alternative and complementary healing 
practices. Lisa is also the Buddhism editor for BellaOnline.com, the largest non-profit 
women's website on the web, and a writer for Buddha Chick Life, an online women's 
spirituality magazine. She has a self-paced course offered through DailyOm.com on 
women's energetics. Lisa is a second-degree black belt in Shotokan karate, a graduate 
of Sarah Lawrence College, a former Fortune 500 technology executive, and mother to 
3 kids and 3 pets. She resides in Los Angeles, CA.

MIEKO FAILEY
Mieko Failey is a Loyola Law School Post Graduate Public Interest Fellow at the L.A. 
Gay and Lesbian Center, providing legal protection to LGBTQ youth survivors of dating 
violence, bullying, sexual assault and hate crimes. Previously, Mieko interned for The 
ACLU of Southern California’s LGBT Student Rights Project and the L.A. Gay & Lesbian 
Center’s Domestic Violence Legal Advocacy Project. She also interned for The Center 
for Juvenile Law and Policy, advocating for those who were wrongfully convicted or 
unfairly sentenced as juveniles. Mieko graduated with highest distinction from The 
University of California at Berkeley with a Bachelor of Arts degree in Sociology 
concentrating on Gender and Women’s Studies, Identity, and Sexuality and recently 
graduated from Loyola Law School of Los Angeles where she received her Juris 
Doctorate with a Public Interest Concentration. While attending Loyola Law School, 
Mieko was the President of OutLaw, Loyola’s LGBTQ student group. She also worked 
with The Juvenile Rights Project, providing “Know Your Rights Workshops” to high 
school students targeted by racial profiling, and co-authored an article on human 
trafficking published in the Huffington Post. Prior to attending law school, Mieko worked 
as a peer educator conducting workshops on sexual assault, rape and 
domestic violence to fraternities and sororities on the UC Berkeley campus, and worked 
formany years as an early childhood educator. She has received awards from the Los 
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Angeles Lesbian and Gay Lawyers Association and The National LGBT Bar Association 
for her advocacy on behalf of LGBTQ civil rights.

MYRA FERELL-WOMOCHIL
Myra Ferell-Womochil is the Executive Director at Victim Witness Services of Coconino 
County, but has only been in that role since mid-May of this year. Previous to that,  she 
was the Director of Community Based Services at Northland Family Help Center 
(NFHC) in Flagstaff, AZ.  During her eight years it NFHC,  she co-established a county 
fatality review board reviewing domestic violence homicides, revitalized the Coordinated 
Community Response Team to Domestic Violence and Sexual Assault,  provided legal 
advocacy for women fleeing domestic violence and developed and implemented two 
sexual violence prevention programs. In particular,  Myra worked on the BARS Project. 
The BARS Project was started in 2008 in response to the state plan to incorporate 
sexual violence prevention programs in alcohol serving establishments.   The BARS 
project was so successful that the Arizona Department of Health Services decided to 
further develop the program and take it across the state.  It is now called the Arizona 
Safer Bars Alliance (ASBA) and has begun being implemented in Flagstaff,  Prescott, 
Prescott Valley,  Tucson,  Phoenix and Scottsdale.  Myra is also very proud to be an 
Ethnic Studies Professor at Northern Arizona University.

VAL FERGUSON
Val Fergus, Sisters of Color Ending Sexual Assault (SCESA)

MICHAEL FLEMING
Michael Fleming, Ph.D., is an associate professor of family studies in the School of 
Applied Human Sciences at UNI. Prior to entering the academic world he was a 
marriage and family therapist for many years where he specialized in working with 
families with adolescents. He obtained his Ph.D. from the University of Wisconsin-
Madison where much of his work focused on working with communities dealing with at-
risk youth issues. He has worked on local, state and federal grants as an evaluator and 
program development consultant with a particular focus on violence prevention. His 
research and programmatic interests include violence prevention and early intervention 
program models with particular focus on men’s roles in violence prevention; the etiology 
of male relational and sexual aggression, high-conflict families; and fathering and 
nonresidential fathering. He teaches courses on intimate partner violence, family 
assessment and intervention, and program development.

KATHRYN FORD
As a Senior Associate at the Center for Court Innovation since 2004, Kathryn Ford 
addresses the issues of domestic violence, sexual assault, and child abuse through 
needs assessment research, dissemination of best practices, and the provision of 
training and technical assistance to state and tribal courts, including through the 
Center’s Tribal Justice Exchange. She has published articles in Sexual Assault Report, 
Family & Intimate Partner Violence Quarterly, and NCADV’s The Voice, has authored 
several Center publications on domestic violence, and has conducted training 
workshops for over 4,000 participants from multiple disciplines. Ms. Ford also conducts 



trauma-focused individual and group therapy and provides court support services 
through the Center’s Child and Adolescent Witness Support Program at the Bronx 
District Attorney’s Office. Prior to joining the Center, Ms. Ford was a social worker in 
Safe Horizon's Supervised Visitation Program at Bronx Family Court and an intern in the 
Kings County District Attorney's Office’s Counseling Services Unit. She received a 
Bachelor’s Degree in Psychology and Sociology from Tufts University and a Master’s in 
Social Work from Columbia University, and is certified in Rape Crisis Counseling.

MARIE FORTUNE
Founder and Senior Analyst at FaithTrust Institute, Dr. Fortune is a pastor, author, 
educator and practicing ethicist and theologian. Dr. Fortune grew up in North Carolina 
where she received her undergraduate degree from Duke University. She received her 
seminary training at Yale Divinity School and was ordained a minister in the United 
Church of Christ in 1976. After serving in a local parish, she founded the Center for the 
Prevention of Sexual and Domestic Violence in 1977 and served as Executive Director 
until 1999. Today this nonprofit is known as FaithTrust Institute, where Dr. Fortune 
serves as Founder and Senior Analyst. FaithTrust Institute is a national, multifaith, 
multicultural organization providing religious communities and advocates with training, 
consultation and educational materials to address the faith aspects of abuse. She was 
Editor of The Journal of Religion and Abuse (2000–2008) and served on the National 
Advisory Council on Violence Against Women for the U.S. Department of Justice (1995–
2000) and the Defense Task Force on Domestic Violence for the U.S. Department of 
Defense (2000–2003).For more information regarding FaithTrust Institute presenters 
and services, please contact training@faithtrustinstitute.org.

GRACE FRANCES
Grace Frances serves as the Certification and Programs Manager at the Florida Council 
Against Sexual Violence (FCASV), overseeing the certification of Florida’s 29 rape crisis 
programs and developing and providing training for a variety of local, statewide and 
national groups on sexual violence issues. She founded the Statewide Sexual Assault 
Response Team (SART) Advisory Committee, a joint project of FCASV, the Office of the 
Attorney General and the Florida Sheriff’s Association. Ms. Frances established and 
coordinates FCASV’s rural sexual assault project which is in its second round of funding 
through the Office on Violence Against Women. The project funds sexual assault victim 
services and SART development in four rural counties. Ms. Frances has worked as a 
community organizer for non-profit public interest groups and worked for the Florida 
House of Representatives. She received her bachelor’s degree in Eugene, Oregon from 
the University of Oregon.

ANTHONY FRISBEE
Anthony Frisbee, Detective Sargeant UC Irvine Police Department

NATE GALBREATH
Nate Galbreath is the Senior Executive Advisor, Accountability and Assessment, for the 
Department of Defense Sexual Assault Prevention and Response Office (SAPRO). In 
this position, he directs or consults on DoD Sexual Assault Prevention and Response 



(SAPR) programs, training initiatives, and research involving applications of behavioral 
health, forensic science, criminal investigation, and program evaluation. Dr. Galbreath 
reports directly to the SAPRO Director, who serves as the single point of authority, 
accountability, and oversight for the SAPR program in the Department of Defense. 
While serving as a Special Agent with the Air Force Office of Special Investigations, Dr. 
Galbreath earned a Master of Forensic Science from the George Washington University, 
Washington, DC in 1993. He earned a Ph.D. in Clinical Psychology from the Uniformed 
Services University of the Health Sciences (USUHS), Bethesda, MD in 2004. He has 
also completed a number of internships and fellowships, including a fellowship in 
Forensic Medicine at the Office of the Armed Forces Medical Examiner, Armed Forces 
Institute of Pathology, Washington, DC, and a clinical psychology residency at Malcolm 
Grow Medical Center, Andrews Air Force Base, MD. He also evaluated and treated sex 
offenders with Dr. Fred S. Berlin at the National Institute for the Study, Prevention and 
Treatment of Sexual Trauma, Baltimore, MD. He is currently a licensed psychologist in 
the state of Maryland.

MICHELLE M. GARCIA
Michelle M. Garcia has worked to end violence against women for over twenty years, 
and since 2006 has led the Stalking Resource Center (SRC) of the National Center for 
Victims of Crime in meeting its mission to enhance the ability of professionals, 
organizations, and systems to effectively respond to stalking. She coordinates all 
aspects of the SRC’s provision of training and technical assistance, material and 
resource development, and media relations. Ms. Garcia has provided training and 
assistance on various aspects of stalking to tens of thousands of professionals 
internationally. Additionally, she manages the day to day operations of the SRC, 
including project development, strategic planning, grant writing and administration, 
budget development and administration, and hiring and supervising staff. Prior to joining 
the SRC, Michelle was a Program Specialist with the U.S. Department of Justice Office 
for Victims of Crime. Previously, she had worked in community-based sexual assault 
and domestic violence programs as an administrator, advocate, crisis counselor, and an 
educator and trainer on topics, including sexual assault, domestic violence, dating 
violence, and dismantling oppression. She is a former President of the Illinois Coalition 
Against Sexual Assault. Ms. Garcia currently serves on the Editorial Board of the Sexual 
Assault Report, the American Bar Association Commission on Domestic & Sexual 
Violence, and the Advisory Board of School and College Organization for Prevention 
Educators (SCOPE). She received her Master of Public Policy degree from the 
University of Chicago.

ZOE GASCON
Zoë Gascon is the Legal Projects Coordinator at the Vermont Network Against Domestic 
and Sexual Violence. Zoë began working in the movement to end violence against 
women as a volunteer with a shelter program while in graduate school in Wyoming in 
the early 1990s. She worked for 12 years at a community Domestic and Sexual 
Violence Program as both an advocate and the Program Coordinator. Zoë also worked 
as the advocate with a special domestic violence prosecution unit in rural Vermont and 
also spent a year as an Americorps/ VISTA volunteer for a domestic and sexual violence 



program. Zoë has a B.S. in Secondary Education/Social Science, an M.A. in American 
Studies and enjoys outdoor activities with her partner, two children, and two dogs.

THERESA GERRIOR
Theresa Gerrior conducts formal investigations and informal resolution of complaints 
alleging discrimination, retaliation, sexual harassment, and sexual assault. She 
responds to complaints filed with outside agencies including the Department of Fair 
Employment and Housing (DFEH), the Equal Employment Opportunity Commission 
(EEOC), and the Office of Civil Rights (OCR). Theresa also conducts a variety of 
presentations and workshops on sexual harassment prevention, nondiscrimination, 
diversity, cultural awareness, and cross-cultural communication for students, faculty and 
staff. She earned her B.A. at the University of New Hampshire, where she double 
majored in Political Science and Women´s Studies. She holds a Master´s degree from 
Simmons College in Gender and Cultural Studies, and a Master of Dispute Resolution 
Degree from Pepperdine University School of Law. Prior to joining UCI, she worked as a 
discrimination investigator for the State of New Hampshire.

MARK S. GHILARDUCCI
Mark S. Ghilarducci is the Director of the California Governor's Office of Emergency 
Services. Prior to his appointment, Ghilarducci was a partner and managing director at 
Diamante Partners LLC. He was vice president of Witt and Associates from 2003 to 
2011, deputy director for the Governor’s Office of Emergency Services from 2000 to 
2003, a federal coordinating officer for the United States Federal Emergency 
Management Agency from 1997 to 2000 and deputy fire chief for the Governor’s Office 
of Emergency Services from 1988 to 1997.

ANNIKA M. GIFFORD
Annika M. Gifford has both U.S. and international experience in the anti-violence 
against women movement. Currently, she manages policy and research efforts at the 
National Resource Center on Domestic Violence including, Building Comprehensive 
Solutions to Domestic Violence and the DV Evidence Project. Prior to joining the 
NRCDV, Annika spent four years working in Croatia for the Centre for Women's Studies, 
Zagreb. Her work focused on gender mainstreaming, capacity building, human rights 
and justice, and anti-violence against women. While living in Zagreb, Annika also co-
founded a Croatian non-profit and non-governmental organization for children and youth 
with disabilities. After Croatia, Annika pursued a Masters of Arts in Gender and Peace 
Building from the United Nations mandated University for Peace in Costa Rica, which 
she received in June 2006. She currently serves on the Advisory Board of the Asian & 
Pacific Islander Institute on Domestic Violence. Annika loves to cook (and eat), read 
mysteries, dance and travel, which is particularly adventurous as she has no sense of 
direction.

PATTI GIGGANS
Patti Giggans, Executive Director POV



MELISSA GOPNIK
Melissa Gopnik is the Managing Director for the Boston Area Rape Crisis Center and a 
Facilitator of the Independent Rape Crisis Center Peer Exchange. Throughout her 
career, Ms. Gopnik has combined her talents in strategic planning, translating academic 
research, program development, and training with a strong commitment to social 
service. In her work with non-profit agencies as diverse as the Boston Area Rape Crisis 
Center, the Uphams Corner Health Center, and the Jewish Women’s Archive, Ms. 
Gopnik has envisioned and implemented the kind of strategic plan and new programs 
that make organizations work smarter and serve their clients better. At the Boston Area 
Rape Crisis Center, she is involved in developing and delivering new training curricula 
on preventing sexual violence and developing a national network of independent rape 
crisis centers. Ms. Gopnik has an MBA and a Diploma in Non-Profit Management from 
Boston University and a BA from McGill University.

LAURA GRAHAM
Laurie Graham, MSW, has worked with survivors of violence since 2008, first as a 
volunteer and later as a professional. While in the Master of Social Work (MSW) 
program at UNC-Chapel Hill, Laurie worked with child survivors of abuse and neglect 
through the provision of foster care services. She gained further experience working 
with child, adolescent, and adult survivors of sexual and intimate partner violence and in 
sexual violence prevention at Family Violence and Rape Crisis Services of Chatham 
County, NC. After receiving her MSW in 2011, Laurie joined the Orange County Rape 
Crisis Center as the Crisis Response Coordinator. In this position, she managed the 
crisis response program, supervised and trained help line volunteers, and coordinated 
the Orange County Sexual Assault Response Team (SART). In 2012, Laurie became 
the Center’s Programs Director and now oversees the Center’s community education, 
crisis response, Latino/a services, and support group programs; provides training and 
consultation to community professionals; trains and supervises the Center’s volunteer 
Support Group Facilitators; co-facilitates support groups; and provides crisis 
intervention services in both English and Spanish. In her current role, Laurie has had 
the opportunity to collaborate with the North Carolina Coalition Against Sexual Assault 
(NCCASA) in assisting agencies across the state with improving service delivery and 
programming.

ORLENE GRAY-DAVIS
Orlene Gray-Davis, Sisters of Color Ending Sexual Assault (SCESA)

DONNS GRECO
Donna Greco is the director of training and technical assistance at the National Sexual 
Violence Resource Center. Donna has worked in the anti-violence and economic justice 
movements for 14 years, and her work focuses in large part on the intersections of 
sexual violence and economic insecurity.

KAI M. GREEN
Kai M. Green is a writer, scholar, poet, filmmaker, abolitionist, feminist and whatever 
else it takes to make a way towards a new and more just world. He examines questions 



of gendered and racialized violence in his art and scholarship. His film It Gets Messy in 
Here examines the lives of transgender men and masculine identified women of color 
and their bathroom experiences. Kai is a PhD candidate in the department of American 
Studies and Ethnicity at USC, where he is completing his dissertation, “Into the 
Darkness: A Black Queer (Re)Membering of Los Angeles in a Time of Crises.” Kai is 
member of the Community Coalition to End Sheriff on Inmate Violence in LA County 
Jails, where he also serves on the editorial board of the organizations’ quarterly 
publication, Dignity and Power Now. Kai is committed to creating consciousness raising 
art and scholarship. You can find his video work here: http://www.youtube.com/user/
DrGreen85. He has two Blogs as well: 1) http://justmyimaginings.blogspot.com
2) http://road2darkness.blogspot.com/. He can be contacted for film screenings, 
purchases, and/or talks at kai.m.green51@gmail.com or on Twitter: @Kai_MG

WILLIAM GREEN
Dr. Green has been on the faculty of the University of California, Davis Medical School 
since 1976. He retired as a Clinical Professor of Emergency Medicine in June 2011 but 
maintains a clinical appointment in Emergency Medicine and remains active in clinical 
forensic medical research both in the Emergency Department and with the Masters 
program in Forensic Science. Since 1985 he has been a consultant to the California 
Emergency Management Agency. Since 1983 Dr. Green participated in the 
development of the California Medical Protocol for Examination of Sexual Assault 
Victims and in 2001 chaired the committee that revised the protocol. In 1989, Dr. Green 
was one of the founders of the Sexual Assault Forensic Evaluation (SAFE) Team at the 
University of California, Davis Medical Center and served as the team's Medical Director 
from 1989 to 2010. In 1990, he was appointed by the California Commission on the 
Status of Women to CalEMA's State Advisory Committee that oversees services to 
sexual assault victims. In 2007 Dr. Green founded and co-chaired the Forensic 
Medicine Section in the American College of Emergency Physicians (ACEP). Most 
recently Dr. Green was asked to serve as advisor to the U.S. Department of Justice and 
the White House on sexual assault matters. Dr. Green was one of the founding faculty 
members of the Graduate Group in Forensic Sciences that created the Forensic 
Science Masters Program at UC Davis. His primary research interest is sexual assault, 
which includes the epidemiology of sexual assault, the forensic medical examination, 
forensic evidence collection and evaluation, the delivery of sexual assault services, and 
criminal justice outcomes.

EMILY GREYTAK
Emily Greytak, PhD, serves as the Evaluation Coordinator on the Board of Directors of 
SAFER (Students Active for Ending Rape). SAFER is a national, nonprofit organization 
that fights sexual violence and rape culture by empowering student-led campaigns to 
reform college sexual assault policies. Before joining SAFER in 2011, Emily had a long 
history with student activism - she first became involved in the anti-sexual violence 
movement as a college student when she coordinated the campus sexual assault 
education program and helped to rewrite the campus policy. Following her graduation, 
she worked as a counselor, advocate, and educator at a rape crisis center and then 
served as the advisor of Students Together Against Acquaintance Rape (STAAR) at the 
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University of Pennsylvania where she received her doctorate in Education. Emily now 
uses her research skills to further social justice by working with organizations devoted to 
combating violence and ensuring safe and supportive school environments for all. In 
addition to her role on the SAFER Board, she is currently the Senior Research 
Associate at GLSEN (Gay, Lesbian & Straight Education Network) and has also served 
as a research and evaluation consultant to a variety of non-profit and education 
organizations, including the Pennsylvania Coalition Against Rape and Campus 
Outreach Services. Emily has presented at numerous conferences, such as the 
National Conference on Campus Sexual Assault, the National Coalition Against Sexual 
Assault Conference, and the American Educational Research Association Annual 
Meeting, and her research has been published in a variety of publications, including the 
Journal of School Violence and the Prevention Researcher.

ALISON HALL
Alison Hall, ED Pittsburgh Action Against Rape

DAWN D. HANKINS
Lieutenant Colonel Dawn D. Hankins is the Chief, Special Victims' Counsel (SVC) 
Program for the Military Justice Division of the Air Force Legal Operations Agency. She 
is responsible for developing policies and procedures for the SVC Program and 
provides professional oversight for 60 judge advocates serving as SVCs. Lt Col Hankins 
received a direct commission as an Air Force judge advocate in March 1995 and 
entered active duty in June 1995. She has served as a wing staff judge advocate, 
deployed staff judge advocate, deputy staff judge advocate, an area defense counsel, 
and legal advisor for two Aircraft Accident Investigation Boards and for the Air 
Expeditionary Force Battlelab. She is admitted to practice law before the State of New 
York Supreme Court, Appellate Division, Third Judicial Department and the United 
States Court of Appeals for the Armed Forces.

KATIE HANNA
Katie joined OAESV in October 2011. She manages the day to day operations and 
provides technical assistance, training, coalition building and support to sexual assault 
service providers across Ohio. She co-chairs the Sexual Assault Advisory Board of 
Ohio. She holds a Master’s degree in Counseling from Ohio University, is a licensed 
Professional Clinical Counselor and holds a BFA in Photography from the Rochester 
Institute of Technology. She has an Executive Coaching certificate from the 
Weatherhead School of Management at CWRU and a certificate from the Women Staff 
Leadership Development Initiative. Prior to joining OAESV she was the Women’s Health 
Advocate for five years at the Flora Stone Mather Center for Women at CWRU. She is 
the 2011 recipient of the American College Health Association’s New Professional 
Award through the Ohio College Health Association and contributed as a Task Force 
member to A Safer Campus, a guidebook on prevention and response to sexual and 
intimate partner violence and stalking for Ohio campuses.



BEA HANSON
Bea Hanson is the Acting Director of the United States Department of Justice Office on 
Violence Against Women (OVW).  As Director, she serves as the liaison between the 
Department of Justice and federal, state, tribal, and international governments on 
matters involving violence against women.  She is responsible for developing the 
Department’s legal and policy positions regarding the implementation of the Violence 
Against Women Act and overseeing an annual budget of nearly $400 million.  Prior to 
her appointment as Acting Director, Ms. Hanson served as OVW’s Principal Deputy 
Director since May 2011.
Ms. Hanson previously served as Chief Program Officer for Safe Horizon, a crime victim 
service organization in New York City that serves 350,000 victims annually, where she 
directed a staff of 500 in 60 locations.  She joined Safe Horizon (formerly Victim 
Services) in 1997 as the Director of Emergency Services and went on to oversee the 
agency’s domestic violence, homeless youth, and child abuse programs before being 
promoted to Chief Program Officer.
Ms. Hanson earned a Doctor of Philosophy in Social Welfare degree from City 
University in New York, a Master of Social Work degree from Hunter College School of 
Social Work in New York, and a Bachelor of Arts degree from the University of Michigan 
in Ann Arbor.

ALAN HEISTERKAMP
Dr. Heisterkamp is the director of the MVP Leadership Institute at the Center for 
Violence Prevention at the University of Northern Iowa in Cedar Falls, Iowa. Among his 
duties as director, he oversees curriculum infusion of bystander strategies within pre-
service teacher education program, and MVP training and outreach to Iowa’s K-12 
educational system. As president and CEO of Cultivating Minds, Inc., Dr. Heisterkamp 
served as an education consultant and researcher with the Waitt Institute for Violence 
Prevention on a five-year study, entitled the Sioux City Project, which sought to engage 
adults in talking to youth about gender violence being wrong, increase the number of 
youth who believe gender violence is wrong, and increase the number of youth 
intervene against gender violence. Dr. Heisterkamp has also co-facilitated research on a 
gender violence prevention program entitled, Coaching Boys Into Men. He frequently 
speaks to adults and community organizations on bystander education and gender 
violence prevention strategies and has trained hundreds of high school, college 
students and educators. Dr. Heisterkamp served as a secondary mathematics teacher, 
athletic coach, school counselor, and school administrator for 22 years. He holds a 
Masters degree in educational psychology and counseling and a doctorate degree in 
secondary school administration.

DEB HELT
Rev. Deb Helt Hosanna Christian Fellowship, Lititz, PA, Certified Safe Church Facilitator

PRENTIS HEMPHILL
Prentis Hemphill is a Black, Queer, gender non-conforming, writer, fundraiser, and
politicized healer/therapist born and raised in Texas and currently living in Los Angeles, 



California. Prentis has worked with Community United Against Violence, 
generationFIVE, and most recently as a collective member and fundraiser at Gender 
Justice LA. What has guided Prentis through all of these journeys is a deep commitment 
to transformative justice responses to harm, to bringing about the end of all forms of 
oppression, and the possibility of recovering, together, the place where liberation and 
healing meet.

INDIRA HENDARD
Indira Henard has been employed at the DC Rape Crisis Center since January 2009. In 
her current role as the Counseling and Advocacy Program Manager she is responsible 
for managing the client intake system, database system, client outreach as well as 
special programming and support groups. Indira also see’s individual and group clients 
and she is the Special Assistant to the Director of Counseling and Advocacy & Interim 
Executive Director. Indira truly is a “Renaissance Woman” at the DC Rape Crisis Center 
and she keeps “The trains moving on time.” Indira received her BA Degree from 
Wheaton College in Norton, MA and her MA Degree from the University of Chicago. She 
has also done advance graduate work at Duke University and Georgetown University 
Law Center. Indira comes to the Violence against Women Movement from a political 
background, in which her first career was politics and working on the 2008 Presidential 
Campaign for President Obama. Indira then decided to follow her heart and passion and 
pursue Violence against Women’s Issues full time. She is truly humbled to be working 
on the frontlines for survivors and considers this her life’s work.

SANDRA HENRIQUEZ
Sandra Henriquez has worked in the anti-sexual and domestic violence field since 1985. 
In 2010, Ms. Henriquez was appointed as the Executive Director of the California 
Coalition Against Sexual Assault (CALCASA). Prior to 2010, Ms. Henriquez was the 
Associate Director at a dual, Los Angeles-based (sexual and domestic violence) 
intervention and prevention agency, Peace Over Violence. Ms. Henriquez is published 
in the Hastings Women’s Law Journal and has been a contributor to numerous 
publications on issues pertaining to violence against women and children, including the 
cultural adaptation of a book on teen dating violence, Jovenes: Enamorados y En 
Peligro. Ms. Henriquez has also been active in local, state and national policy efforts. 

CAROL HENSELL
Carol Hensell has been in state service since 1997, and in 2000 became the Program 
Manager of the Sexual Violence Prevention and Education Program (SVPEP) at the 
Arizona Department of Health Services (ADHS). She is responsible for overseeing 
contract compliance and works closely with the Sexual Violence Prevention and 
Education contractors and the Centers for Disease Control. She has served on the 
Governor’s Commission on Violence Against Women, the Campus Sexual Assault Task 
Force, Child Abuse / Sexual Assault committee to plan the prevention track of Arizona’s 
statewide conference, sat on the Department of Defense (DOD) Prevention of Sexual 
Assault Task Force as well as various other committees. Currently she is a regional 
representative for the Sexual Violence Prevention and Education Directors’ Council 
through the Centers for Disease Control and the State Agency Coordination Team. She 



also goes “out in field” and does sexual violence training to community groups such as 
faith-based, teen moms and local cosmetology schools. Additionally she spearheaded 
Arizona’s first Sexual Violence Prevention and Education PSA which aired in 2004 and 
won a HEMMY award. In May of 2006 Mrs. Hensell was named by former Governor 
Napolitano as ‘State Employee of the Month” for her work in the field. In 2009 she was 
awarded the “Cherish the Children” award for her work in S.V. primary prevention. Mrs. 
Hensell also is a military wife to an army reservist who has served three tours in theater. 
(Iraq and Afghanistan). Ms. Hensell has earned recognition by the Department of 
Defense, as an outstanding mentor to military families through teaching at various 
family/military academies and one-on-one meetings. With respect to ASBA, she co-
presented two webinars about ASBA with sexual violence prevention and education 
half-time Epidemiologist. One was to the alcohol-workgroup at the Centers for Disease 
Control and the other was to the Florida Department of Health. Mrs. Hensell also 
conducted the first multi-session pilot of the ASBA curriculum.

LEIGH NACHMAN-HOFHEIMER
Leigh Nachman Hofheimer has over 25 years of experience in the field of domestic 
violence work. She has worked in community-based domestic violence advocacy 
programs, battered women’s shelters, and as an advocate for battered women and their 
children in the health care system, criminal and civil legal system as well as general 
systems advocacy within a variety of institutions. She has trained multi-disciplined 
practitioners including: health care providers in clinic and hospital settings, domestic 
and sexual violence advocates, representatives of criminal and civil legal system, social 
service agencies and batterer’s intervention treatment providers. (Program Coordinator 
for PPWT, Washington Coalition Against Domestic Violence)

LEAH HOLLAND
Leah Holland, Program Coordinator for the Pregnant and Parenting Women and Teens 
Grant, Washington Coalition of Sexual Assault Programs

DYAMOND HOUSTON
Dyamond Houston is a Long Walk Home, Inc. Girl/Friends alumna. At the Coalition, she 
works to develop public policy statewide that supports the self-determination and safety 
of survivors of domestic violence (and their children). Additionally, Leigh provides 
technical assistance and training to Coalition members which include direct service 
victim/survivor advocacy agencies and individuals throughout Washington State.

DOLORES HUERTA
Dolores Huerta is the President of the Dolores Huerta Foundation and Co-founder of the 
United Farm Workers (UFW). Her lifelong journey has been working as a Community 
Organizer and Social Activist for over 50 years.  Huerta has played a major role in the 
American Civil Rights Movement. A founding board member of the Feminist Majority 
Foundation, she also serves on the board of Ms. Magazine. Numerous awards received 
among the Eleanor Roosevelt Human Rights Award from President Clinton ’98, Ms. 
Magazine’s one of the three most important women of ‘97, Ladies Home Journal’s 100 
most important woman of the 20th Century, Puffin Foundation award for Creative 



Citizenship Labor Leader Award 1984, Kern County’s woman of the year by California 
State legislature, the Ohtli award from the Mexican Government, Smithsonian Institution 
- James Smithson Award and the Icons of the American Civil Rights Movement Award, 
bestowed to her in 2011 by the National Civil Rights Museum. She is a former UC 
Regent and has earned nine honorary doctorates from universities throughout the 
United States. Her most recent recognitions include her induction to the U.S. 
Department of Labor Hall of Honor, the 2012 Presidential Medal of Freedom and the 
California Hall of Fame in 2013. As one of the most famous and celebrated Latinas in 
the U.S., Huerta has been an advocate for women’s rights and reproductive freedom. 
She continues working to develop community leaders, for working poor, immigrants, 
women and youth, with the Dolores Huerta Foundation. She speaks at universities or 
organizational forums on issues of social justice and public policy.

SANDRA HUNTZINGER
Sandra Huntzinger, MSW. Ms. Huntzinger has been a committed advocate on the issue 
of sexual and domestic violence for over a decade. She started as a legal advocate 
working as a liaison between the courts and local domestic violence shelter. For over six 
years Ms. Huntzinger worked on public policy through her position with the Ohio 
Domestic Violence Network (ODVN) and was integral in developing ODVN’s Training 
Institute. She continues her role making systemic change in her current position as the 
Victim Service Coordinator for the Ohio Attorney General’s Sexual Assault Forensic 
Exam program. In this position, she manages a $3.5 million reimbursement program for 
sexual assault evidence collection kits and has expanded the program by offering 
technical assistance and training on sexual assault and domestic violence. Ms. 
Huntzinger facilitates a statewide team of sexual assault experts on modeling the 
benefits of Sexual Assault Response Teams (SART), with the overarching goal of 
helping communities respond with a continuum of care for survivors of sexual violence.

CHRISTI HURT
Christi Hurt has been advocating to end sexual violence and support victims/survivors 
for more than 20 years. She has worked as an advocate and a staff administrator at her 
local rape crisis center, as the Associate/Acting Director at the Washington Coalition of 
Sexual Assault Programs, and on the National Sexual Assault Resource Sharing Project 
as a technical assistance provider and publications specialist. She is currently the 
Director of the Carolina Women's Center at the University of North Carolina at Chapel 
Hill, where she focused on gender equity/social justice organizing for staff, students, 
and faculty on campus. Christi also serves as the Project Coordinator for the North 
Carolina Coalition for the Prevention of Child Sexual Abuse, which is in partnership with 
Prevent Child Abuse North Carolina and the Ms. Foundation for Women. In that role, 
Christi helps to coordinate statewide efforts to end CSA through systems reform, policy 
development, and community collaboration. Christi has her Master in Public 
Administration, with a specialization in nonprofit management, and lives in Chapel Hill, 
NC with her two sons, partner, and high-anxiety dog.



HEATHER IMRIE
Heather Imrie M.Ed.is a popular anti-violence and social justice educator from Chicago 
IL with over fifteen years experience advocating for survivors and providing prevention 
and awareness programming. She has developed curriculum, and provided training for 
military, advocacy, police, medical and collegiate audiences. She served as a subject 
matter expert (SME) and trainer for the U.S. Air Force-wide Bystander Intervention 
initiative; co-developed and taught a Gender and Women’s Studies Peer Education 
class at The University of Illinois at Chicago (UIC) entitled :Peer Educators Reducing 
Campus Violence Creating Social Change and created training for the Catharsis 
Productions prevention initiative at Naval Station Great Lakes. She is the creator of “the 
Hook-Up” and the co-creator of the “Force of Awesome Institute” a program that 
incorporates active coaching and curriculum analysis for violence prevention educators. 
Ms. Imrie is the former Associate Director of the Campus Advocacy Network (CAN) at 
UIC. She is currently the Director of Program Development for Catharsis Productions. 
Ms. Imrie has a M.Ed. in Educational Leadership from the University of Illinois at 
Chicago (UIC) and is currently working towards her PhD in Educational Psychology at 
the UIC.

WENDY IVY
Wendy Ivy is the Director of Outreach & Community Services for the Zacharias Sexual 
Abuse Center in Gurnee Illinois. Wendy has been at the Center for 12 years and has 
worked in social service for 28 years. Prior to her work with the Zacharias Sexual Abuse 
Center, she worked alongside People with Disabilities in all aspects of their lives for 16 
years. Currently she Chairs the Lake County SANE/SART Task Force, sits on the core 
committee of the Lake County Sexual Assault Coordinating Council and is the Chair of 
the Lake County Illinois Imagines committee. Illinois Imagines is a statewide initiative 
assuring that people with disabilities receive accurate training on sexual assault and 
abuse, know their rights, and receive comprehensive care after an assault. Illinois 
Imagines blends Wendy’s work and experience with people with disabilities with her 
passion for anti-violence work. Wendy will continue to work to extend her mission of 
ending sexual violence to all people.

MACILLA (KILA) JAGER
Macilla (Kila) Jager 

CHAI JINDASURAT
Chai Jindasurat is the National Coalition of Anti-Violence Programs (NCAVP) 
Coordinator at the New York City Anti-Violence Project. NCAVP is a national coalition 
that works to prevent, respond to, and end all forms of violence against and within 
lesbian, gay, bisexual, transgender, queer, and HIV-affected (LGBTQH) communities. 
NCAVP strives to increase power, safety, and resources for LGBTQH communities 
through data analysis, policy advocacy, education, and technical assistance. Prior to 
becoming the NCAVP Coordinator, Chai worked at The Network/La Red as an LGBTQ 
anti-violence organizer in Boston, Massachusetts and as the Outreach and Education 
Coordinator at the Kansas City Anti-Violence Project in Kansas City, Missouri. Chai 
entered LGBTQ organizing work as a campus organizer, peer-counselor, and 



community educator while in the LGBT Housing Liaison position at the University of 
Missouri-Kansas City. He is a member of the Gay Asian Pacific-Islander Men of New 
York, and is a former member of the Queer Asian Pacific-Islander Alliance in Boston. 
Chai has presented for local, regional, and national audiences including the National 
Center for Victims of Crime annual conference and the National Gay and Lesbian Task 
Force's Creating Change conference. He has been chosen to attend prestigious 
national roundtables and forums including the Department of Justice's Office for Victims 
of Crime's Vision 21: Enduring Challenges stakeholder forum and the Asian and Pacific-
Islander Institute on Domestic Violenceâ€™s roundtable: Engaging Asian Men in 
Gender Equity. Chai has been featured in local, regional, and national publications 
including the Huffington Post, the Advocate and the Boston Globe.

VIVIAN JOJOLA
Vivian Jojola is a Program Director at JDI. She has been an advocate for survivors of 
domestic violence and sexual assault for more than two decades. She previously 
served as the Director of Volunteer Services at the YWCA of Glendale and at Caring for 
Children and Families with AIDS, both in Los Angeles, and as co-chair of the Board of 
Directors of the Sexual Assault Crisis Agency, in Long Beach, California. Earlier in her 
career, she worked to reduce the transmission of HIV/AIDS among high risk populations 
including sex workers, IV drug users, and the homeless. Prior to joining JDI, Vivian 
spent nearly a decade at the Liberty Hill Foundation.

STEPHANIE JONES
Stephanie Jones is the Victim Advocacy Specialist for the Campus Advocacy Resources 
& Education (CARE) program at UCSB. Stephanie has a Masters in Counseling 
Psychology, is a state certified domestic violence and sexual assault advocate. In her 
role as a victim advocate Stephanie works with survivors of sexual assault, sexual 
harassment, domestic/dating violence and stalking. Stephanie works with survivors to 
ensure that they are aware of resources both through UCSB and in the Santa Barbara 
community. Stephanie serves on the UCSB Coordinated Community Response team 
and has trained campus teaching assistants, psychologists and student health care 
providers on responding to student survivors of interpersonal violence. Stephanie 
regularly presents to student leadership organizations about sexual assault, prevention 
and response. She has worked extensively with the UCSB Greek student population in 
an effort further their knowledge on prevention, bystander intervention and responding 
to survivors. Stephanie has been responsible for the redesign of the UCSB CARE 
program website and worked to make the website more accessible to survivors, their 
friends and family members as well as faculty and staff who are seeking services for 
student survivors. Stephanie is committed to her work as an advocate for those affected 
by interpersonal violence and is thrilled to be a part of the CARE program at UCSB.

MEGAN E. JONES-WILLIAMS
Megan E. Jones-Williams brings an educational background in interpersonal 
communication to her work in the movement to end violence against women. She has 
worked as an advocate, educator, counselor, and activist with crisis centers and gender 
violence prevention programs in Illinois, Iowa, and Missouri. She has created volunteer 



programs, pioneered community awareness campaigns, coordinated conferences, 
counseled survivors, and provided numerous trainings for victim advocates. As part of 
her current position as the Rape Crisis Services Program Coordinator at The Women's 
Center, Inc. in Southern Illinois, Megan supervises counseling and advocacy services 
for victims of sexual violence as well as educational and outreach efforts in the 
community. She is responsible for managing the program budget, writing/reporting of 
state and federal grants, and providing leadership and vision for the program. Megan 
has been the co-chair for the Carbondale-SIU Sexual Assault Response Committee, 
and she provides leadership for the Southern Illinois men’s anti-violence group, 
Progressive Masculinities Mentors. Since beginning work in the gender violence field in 
2001, Megan has attended and presented at numerous local, regional, and national 
conferences. She recently co-presented the workshop “Dialoguing Pop Culture: 
Facilitating Critical Consciousness in Prevention Education” at the 2012 National Sexual 
Assault Conference. Additionally, Megan is an active member of the Governing Body for 
the Illinois Coalition Against Sexual Assault (ICASA), which provides funding, training, 
and technical assistance to rape crisis centers in Illinois. For ICASA, Megan is currently 
the chair of the Contracts Review Committee and a member of the Executive 
Committee; she previously served as chair for the Program Committee, attended the 
Training Committee, assisted with several grievance investigations, and participated in 
strategic planning sessions. Megan’s passion in this field is ensuring that survivors from 
all walks of life have access to the services necessary for their recovery, and teaching 
issues of respect and understanding with the ultimate goal of ending all forms of 
oppression. In addressing the issue of sexual assault, Megan values a comprehensive 
approach that combines high quality service provision with proactive prevention 
education.

AMY JUNG
Amy Jung, Executive Director, Zacharias Sexual Abuse Center

NINA JUSUF
Nina Jusuf has been involved in Domestic Violence and Sexual Assault issues since 
1992. She started as a volunteer and several years later held the Executive Director 
position of a Rape Crisis Center in San Francisco. Nina co-founded a crisis center in 
Indonesia in 1997 and assisted Volunteer of Human Rights in Jakarta, Indonesia in 
setting up support for victims of mass rape after the May 1998 riot. After experiencing 
burnout and watching other sisters leave the movement due to exhaustion, she started 
learning and practicing trauma-based wellness techniques. She has been trained and 
mentored as a trainer by the Capacitar International training team in Trauma-Informed 
wellness and has facilitated sustaining activism and security workshops for Women 
Human Rights Defenders and nongovernmental organizations’ staff globally: USA, 
Regional Asia, Indonesia, Timor Leste, Serbia and the Balkans. Nina co-founded 
NAPIESV and currently is an advisor for Global Fund for Women, Urgent Action Fund, 
Capacitar International and Board member of a Youth LBT organization in Indonesia.



ANNE KANITRA
Anne Kanitra has earned a Bachelor Degree from Michigan State University in Criminal 
Justice and Psychology and has been a certified police officer for over 30 years. She 
has had many roles in the police field including, road patrol, undercover, Detective/
Sergeant, Instructor, and Field training officer. Anne is considered an experienced 
investigator in major crimes, including sexual assault. She is currently an Instructor for 
Michigan Commission on Law Enforcement Standards (MCOLES), specializing in 
Sexual Assault Investigations for law enforcement officers, victim advocates, and 
prosecutors. In addition, she is currently an Investigator in the Criminal Investigations 
Division at the Wayne County Prosecutor’s office.

BARBARA KAPPOS
Barbara Kappos, LCSW currently serves as the Executive Director of the East Los 
Angeles Women’s Center in Los Angeles, California. Ms. Kappos has 25 years of 
experience working in the East Los Angeles community providing services to families in 
need. Ms. Kappos has established a variety of service models based on best practices 
and culturally relevant interventions.  Ms. Kappos is a licensed social worker with 
experience in the field of social work and has been influential in the areas of child 
welfare, HIV/AIDS, domestic violence, sexual assault and substance abuse recovery.  
For over two decades she has provided culturally and gender specific strengthening 
programs for women and their children.

BARBARA KAUFMAN
Dr. Kaufman is a Licensed Clinical Psychologist and a Professor of Psychology at 
Portland State University (PSU) in Portland, Oregon. He has chaired state prevention 
committees in Ohio and Oregon and co-chaired the committee that created Oregon’s 
first statewide sexual violence prevention plan. Dr. Kaufman is also a member of the 
National Coalition to Prevent Child Sexual Abuse and Exploitation. He was on the board 
of the National Alliance of Sexual Assault Coalitions and is a Past President of the 
Association for the Treatment of Sexual Abusers. His clinical work has involved the 
assessment and treatment of both child sexual abuse victims and juvenile sexual 
offenders. Dr. Kaufman has provided program consultation in the areas of prevention, 
intervention, program evaluation, and research. He has developed psycho-educational 
treatment modules for juvenile sex offenders incarcerated by the states of Oregon and 
Ohio. Dr. Kaufman currently provides prevention and safety consultation to Boys & Girls 
Clubs of America and Big Brothers and Big Sisters of America. He also provides 
technical assistance to RPE funded prevention programs in Oregon. Dr. Kaufman has 
authored two books, a variety of book chapters, and numerous research articles 
addressing sexual violence and sexual violence prevention. This work has been 
supported by a number of Federal, State, and local grants. His most recent book, 
Preventing Sexual Violence: A Practitioner's Sourcebook (NEARI Press, 2010) is a 
comprehensive sexual violence prevention volume. Dr. Kaufman co-authored the first 
prevention chapter to be included in Interpol's member manual. He was also recently 
awarded a Vision of Hope grant by the Pennsylvania Coalition Against Rape to support 
the development of a prevention self-assessment strategy based on the Situational 
Prevention Approach for the more than 4000 Boys & Girls Clubs nationwide.



HOLLY KEARL
Holly Kearl is a leading expert on gender-based street harassment and founder of the 
501(c)3) organization Stop Street Harassment. She authored Stop Street Harassment: 
Making Public Places Safe and Welcoming for Women (Prager, 2010) and since then 
has given more than 75 talks and 150 media interviews and her work has been cited by 
the United Nations, CNN, USA Today, the New York Times, the Washington Post, the 
Guardian, NPR, and more.

ZABIE KHORAKIWALA
Zabie Khorakiwala is a sexual assault specialist and currently manages the educational 
and prevention programs on UC Irvine’s campus related to sexual assault, dating and 
domestic violence, and stalking. Zabie earned a Bachelor of Arts degree in Psychology 
and Social Behavior and Education from UC Irvine and did her graduate work in Higher 
Education Administration at The George Washington University. Zabie is a certified yoga 
instructor through Core Power Yoga and is also certified in trauma-sensitive yoga 
instruction through the Trauma Center at JRI. Zabie is the founder of Transcending 
Sexual Violence through Yoga, an organization with a simple mission: empowering 
survivors to heal through yoga. She serves on the Board of Directors for Stop Street 
Harassment, based in Washington DC and she is widely recognized for her hard work 
and dedication to her field, most recently as a finalist for WIN’s Young Women of 
Achievement Award, as a recipient of UC Irvine’s Order of the Laurel Award and the 
Janet Loxley Award, and for her feature in the Huffington Post on yoga therapy. For 
more information on her yoga work with survivors, visit The Breathe Network: http://
thebreathenetwork.org/zahabiyah-khorakiwala.

KHMER THAI LAOS DANCE GROUP
Khmer Thai Laos (KTL) Dance Group was established in 2010 to cherish traditional 
dance styles of the Cambodian, Thai and Lao communities. These dancers came 
together with the passion to learn and understand their culture even more. We focus on 
Cambodian, Thai and Laos dance styles and have been performing all around Long 
Beach, California.

MICHAEL KIMMEL
Michael Kimmel is among the leading researchers and writers on men and masculinity 
in the world today. The author or editor of more than twenty volumes, his books include 
The Guy's Guide to Feminism (2011), Misframing Men (2010), Guyland (2008), The 
Gender of Desire (2005) and The History of Men (2005). The Politics of Manhood 
(1996), Men Confront Pornography (1990), and Changing Men: New Directions in 
Research on Men and Masculinity (1987). He teaches sociology at SUNY Stony Brook. 
A profeminist activist since 1979 when he was among the founders of Santa Cruz Men 
Against Rape and National Organization for Men Against Sexism (NOMAS).

CHRISTINE KREGG
Christine Kregg is a JDI Program Director. She works on several domestic projects to 
ensure inmate safety and to help facilities implement the Prison Rape Elimination Act 
standards. Since joining JDI in 2007, Christine has provided crisis intervention, support, 



information, and referrals to thousands of prisoner rape survivors and their loved ones. 
Her expertise includes providing training for corrections officials and community service 
providers, launching inmate counseling and peer education programs, conducting policy 
analysis, and mobilizing sexual assault response teams in prisons and jails. Christine is 
fluent in Spanish and is a certified rape crisis counselor.

DENICE LABERTEW
Denice Labertew, J.D. is the Director of Advocacy Services for the California Coalition 
Against Sexual Assault and works with sexual assault programs and universities 
nationally to build more effective responses to sexual violence. She has worked to 
develop system wide and legislative policy to address and respond effectively to issues 
of violence against women, has served as an advisor to non-profits on capacity 
development, leadership training and public policy and been an advocate for domestic 
and sexual violence survivors for more than 19 years. During law school, she 
developed , and lead, the first sexual assault civil legal program in California, housed 
within a rape crisis center. She has worked to protect the legal rights of survivors in 
immigration cases, housing cases, educational settings and accessing veteran’s 
benefits. Ms. Labertew has been an advocate, prevention educator and self-defense 
instructor all informing her work on violence against women initiatives. She has been a 
speaker and contributor to publications nationally and internationally on issues of 
violence against women, best practices for serving survivors and policy and systems 
advocacy. Ms. Labertew has a B.A. in Sociology and Women’s Studies and a law 
degree and has served as adjunct faculty at several Los Angeles based colleges and 
law schools.

ANGELA LAKEY
1st LT Angela Lankey, Sexual Assault Response Coordinator, Joint Force Headquarters, 
Vermont National Guard

RACHEL LANGSTON
Rachael Langston is a Staff Attorney in the Disability Rights and Gender Equity and 
LGBT Rights Programs at the Legal Aid Society – Employment Law Center. Rachael 
represents workers who face discrimination based on their disability, gender, sex, or 
status as a survivor of domestic violence of sexual assault. She also provides 
community education regarding employment protections available to workers, and 
participates in legislative advocacy to expand these protections. Rachael received her 
J.D. in 2008 from the University of California, Berkeley.

STEVE LAPORE
Steve brings over 25 years experience in nonprofit management and consulting to 1in6, 
which he founded in January 2007. He originally worked in the private sector as Director 
of Human Resources for Six Flags Corporation and Landmark Entertainment Group. In 
1988, Steve co-founded My Friend’s Place, a resource center for homeless and 
runaway youth in Hollywood, California and became its full-time Executive Director in 
1990. In June 1999, he left My Friend’s Place to found the Santa Clarita Valley Youth 
Project, a community-based outreach program preventing high-risk behavior among 



students in his own community. Steve is a Durfee Foundation Stanton Fellow (having 
researched effective strategies to address difficult social issues and create change 
through program and policy development) and also served on the board of CALCASA 
(the California Coalition Against Sexual Assault).

LAS CAFETERAS
Las Cafeteras sprouted in 2006 as students who enjoyed free Son Jarocho classes & 
decided to share the magic of this folk music from Southern Veracruz with the public. 
Since then their sound has evolved & they've played at community centers, churches, 
schools, museums, parties, protests, youth conferences, theaters, festivals, weddings, 
& art exhibits. Las Cafeteras combines the vibrant energy of Son Jarocho music with an 
edgy LA-alternative sound & political message. Their pounding Afro-Mexican rhythms, 
stomping zapateado dancing, & uplifting lyrics tell stories of everyday people searching 
for love & fighting for justice in the concrete jungle. This alt-son group re-mixes 
traditional sounds, adding Afro-Carribean marimbol, Native American drum & flute, 
cajon, hip hop, English & Spanglish to Jarocho instruments like jarana & requinto 
guitars, donkey jaw-bone, & the tarima (stomp box). http://www.lascafeteras.com

SALLY LASKEY
Sally J. Laskey joined the National Sexual Violence Resource Center in 2001 and 
currently serves as the Director of Special Projects. For over 20 years, Ms. Laskey has 
worked for social change at local, state and national levels. Ms. Laskey received her 
bachelor's in Sociology from the University of New Hampshire, and is currently pursuing 
her master's in Community Psychology and Social Change from Pennsylvania State 
University. She manages several national technical assistance and training projects 
related to strengthening sexual assault advocacy and prevention, and building effective 
and sustainable multidisciplinary responses to sexual assault.

JILL LASTER
Jill Laster is the language access specialist at the National Sexual Violence Resource 
Center.

DAVID S. LEE
David S. Lee, MPH, is the Director of Prevention Services at the California Coalition 
Against Sexual Assault (CALCASA) where he manages PreventConnect, the nations 
leading online community dedicated to advancing the prevention of sexual violence and 
domestic violence. David is a frequent trainer on prevention strategies, an avid social 
media user, and a committed activist to ending violence in our communities. David has 
been involved in the movement to end sexual assault, domestic violence, dating 
violence and child sexual abuse since 1982 working with a variety of local sexual 
assault and domestic violence prevention agencies before joining CALCASA in 2005.

KATE LESSARD
I was born and raised in Brazil. In 1986, I set off to America accompanied by my 
suitcase, my dreams and my boundless curiosity. Through the years, I have been part of 
the breakthroughs women are making in this society and I have been inspired by the 

http://www.lascafeteras.com/
http://www.lascafeteras.com/


strength each one of them exhibits every day in the face of adversity. My professional 
experience consists of working with survivors of sexual assault and domestic violence, 
substance abuse, mental health, and parental abuse. Also, I possess a broad 
understanding of and experience with learning disabilities, child development, anxiety, 
stress, and depression. My long-time commitment to social justice, progressive politics, 
and women’s issues is reflected in my work history. I hold a B.S. in Psychology, and 
currently I am completing my second year, Master Degree program in Social Work at 
Boston University. I am currently employed as a Director of Programs at The Center for 
Hope and Healing, a Rape Crisis Center located at Lowell, Massachusetts.

GUADALUPE LOPEZ
Guadalupe is a citizen of the Leech Lake Anishinabe and works for the Minnesota 
Indian Women's Sexual Assault Coalition as the Technical Assistance Training 
Coordinator. Guadalupe has been organizing community members to end sexual 
violence for over five years and also is an active volunteer sexual assault advocate for 
Sexual Offence Services of Ramsey County. Guadalupe was also one of five 
researchers who interviewed 105 Native women used in prostitution and trafficking for 
their report: Garden of Truth: The Prostitution and Trafficking of Native Women in 
Minnesota.

VEVA LOPEZ
Genoveva Lopez, has a bachelor’s degree in Sociology, is a Certified Counselor/
Advocate for Rape and Battered Victims and a Certified Domestic Violence Counselor. 
Mrs. Lopez joined East Los Angeles Women’s Center in 2008 as a case manager 
providing service assessments, advocacy and resources for survivors of sexual and 
domestic violence. Mrs. Lopez is bilingual and bicultural and supports and empowers 
volunteers at East Los Angeles Women’s Center.

ANNIE LYLES
Annie Lyles, Program Manager at Prevention Institute, oversees projects to prevent 
violence, including community and street violence, violence against women, and sexual 
assault and exploitation. She manages UNITY (Urban Networks to Increase Thriving 
Youth), and she develops and hosts Prevention Institute's contributions to the webinar 
series PreventConnect. Annie is an advisor to STRYVE, the national violence 
prevention initiative at the Centers for Disease Control and Prevention, and to the 
California State Department of Public Health's Teen Dating Violence initiative. She 
coordinated the Ms. Foundation Child Sexual Abuse Prevention Project and trains 
participants in the Catholic Health Initiatives Rural Violence Prevention Grant Program. 
Prior to joining Prevention Institute in 2008, Annie was a program specialist in the 
County of San Diego Office of Violence Prevention, and an adjunct professor at San 
Diego State University. Annie has more than 15 years of experience coordinating and 
providing direct services to families and adolescents through local government, 
community clinics, juvenile detention facilities, and school-based initiatives. She holds a 
BA in Social Policy from Northwestern University and a MSW from University of 
Washington with a concentration on social justice models in multi-ethnic practice.
SHARMILI MAJMUDAR



Sharmili Majmudar, MSW, Executive Director, Rape Victim Advocates

KERRY MAKIN-BYRD
Kerry Makin-Byrd is a clinical psychologist and the Manager for Informatics and 
Dissemination for the VA Mental Health Services Military Sexual Trauma Support Team. 
Her research and clinical interests focus on resilient parenting and the etiology and 
consequences of sexual trauma, family violence, and PTSD.

MARTHA MARIN
Martha is a Colombian native raised in L.A. brings us a unique set of skills acquired 
from many years of for-profit management and a deep dedication to human rights. As a 
Program Coordinator for the Women’s Center of Jacksonville and FL Dept. of Health, 
she taught thousands of students on topics related to the prevention of sexual assault 
including cyber bullying, LGBTQ/sexual harassment, and teen dating violence as well 
as human trafficking. Martha is a public speaker, consultant and professional trainer and 
served previously as the Chair of the Northeast Florida Human Trafficking Coalition. Her 
international projects have included a large-scale bi-lingual internship for the USAID 
Scholarship for Economic Education and Development at FL State College at 
Jacksonville. Martha first identified the lack of services for male survivors while teaching 
at a correctional facility, where she developed the life skills and healing curriculum, 
“YOU ARE WORTHY”!

JODY MARKSAMER
Jody Marksamer, Juvenile Justice Consultant

DAYANARA MARTE
Dayanara Marte is a first generation Latina, Dominican Immigrant from Washington 
Heights, & mother of two dedicated to social justice & humanity. She is a Master of 
Public Health graduate of Columbia University with over 15 years’ experience working 
with womyn, girls & the LGBTQ community on reproductive health, mental health & 
violence prevention. She is nationally known for her work as a trauma prevention 
specialist, internalized oppression healer, trainer & facilitator in emotional release; 
organizing healing circles of self-healing from the impact that oppression, trauma, 
violence & poverty has on the mind, body & spirit. As a certified addiction & recovery 
counselor, she holistically addresses addictions as the result of internalized oppression 
& as dis-ease that manifest in our bodies as a result of institutional racism, homophobia, 
xenophobia, classism, & sexism. She recently founded In Bold Rebirth Consulting, 
providing personal & organizational health care for the mind, body & spirit. This work 
includes spiritual development & transformational leadership, executive coaching, 
identifying capacity building & systems management needs, creating accountability 
structures & systems, & specifying personal & organizational performance evaluation 
systems. Dayanara has developed Conscious Accountability: a trauma informed 
resiliency model that supports young & adult womyn & the LGBTQ community on the 
front lines of their lives in creating healing spaces, self-care action plans & systems of 
personal accountability. Dayanara envisions a world where women young & elder 
powerfully exist in the face of sexual assault, child sexual abuse, incest, rape, 



relationship/partner abuse, & domestic violence within our homes, our organizations & 
within movements. Dayanara has been working for 1 4 years in the South Bronx 
creating programs that reclaim the cultural/spiritual aspect of change to social justice 
movements towards the empowerment, healing & transformation of women of color. In 
2010, Dayanara became a citizen journalist for World Pulse, Voices of Our Future 
Correspondent & Global Connect: A Gender Justice writing project with Women E News 
& the Global Press Institute, founding the Behind the Movement Newsletter.

BECKIE MASAKI
Beckie Masaki, MSW, is the Associate Director of the Asian & Pacific Islander Institute 
on Domestic Violence, a national resource center on gender violence in Asian 
American, Native Hawaiian and Pacific Islander communities. Beckie has worked in the 
movement to end violence against women for thirty years. She co-founded one of the 
first VAW programs in the nation that could meet the language and cultural needs of 
Asian survivors of domestic violence and trafficking, Asian Women’s Shelter in San 
Francisco, and served as the founding executive director for over twenty-one years. 
Beckie has extensive experience in providing multilingual, multicultural services to 
domestic violence and trafficking survivors and their children, innovative program 
development, prevention, community building, policy-making and institutional advocacy. 
Beckie has provided peer-based training, technical assistance, consultation and 
facilitation to a wide range of grassroots groups on local, state, national and 
international levels. She collaborates as faculty for several movement building/ field 
building initiatives including the National Gender and Equity Campaign of Asian 
American Pacific Islanders in Philanthropy, Advocacy Learning Center of Praxis 
International, Supporting Organizational Sustainability project of the Family Violence 
Prevention Fund, Strong Field Project and Building Cultural Competency Initiative of 
Blue Shield Against Violence. Beckie is on the advisory committee and in the pilot 
cohort for Move to End Violence, a ten-year initiative to strengthen our collective 
capacity to end violence against girls and women in the United States.

CEMA MASTROLEO
Cema Mastroleo has a Master of Education from the University of Texas at Austin. She 
has 15 years of experience providing personal safety, healthy relationship and sexuality 
education to youth and adults with various disabilities. Additionally, Cema has 8 years 
experience coordinating training programs on disability awareness and accessibility for 
the criminal justice system and providing training to Adult Protective Services. 
Additionally, Cema has over 30 years experience working with children and adults with 
disabilities in both the United States and in Brazil.

NICOLE MATTHEWS
Nicole Matthews is a member of the White Earth Band of Ojibwe, and is the Executive 
Director for the Minnesota Indian Women's Sexual Assault Coalition, a statewide tribal 
coalition for American Indian Sexual Assault Advocates in Minnesota. The mission of 
this coalition is to strengthen the voices of American Indian women to create 
awareness, influence social change, and reclaim the traditional values that honor the 
sovereignty of American Indian women and children, thereby eliminating the sexual 



violence perpetrated against them. Their vision is: Creating Safety and Justice for 
Native Women Through the Teachings of Our Grandmothers. Nicole received her 
Bachelor of Science degree from St. Cloud State University in Applied Psychology 
including a minor in Human Relations and Multicultural Education. Nicole was also one 
of fie researchers who interviewed 105 Native women used in prostitution and trafficking 
for their report: "Garden of Truth: The Prostitution and Trafficking of Native Women in 
Minnesota."

ANN MCCARTY
Ann McCarty serves as the Associate Director for the North County Rape Crisis and 
Child Protection Center and has more than 18 years' experience working with victims of 
sexual violence and interpersonal violence. Mrs. McCarty is experienced in developmg 
programs and lead1ng individuals through the conceptualization process. She is 
recogmzed nationally as an expert on military interaction with sexual assault survivors 
and has been instrumental m solidifying the relationship between Vandenberg Air Force 
Base (AFB) officials and the Sexual Assault Response Team of Santa Barbara County. 
She began an early training program With the Office of Special Investigations (OSI) and 
has provided countless hours of training to agents responsible for investigating sexual 
assaults of military members. Additionally, Mrs. McCarty has trained numerous Victim 
Advocates through the Sexual Assault Prevention and Response Office (SAPRO) at 
Vandenberg AFB. Her ability to connect with team members and to explain the process 
of a sexual assault forensic exam by providing an interactive training makes Mrs. 
McCarty the go-to-person for individuals in the SAPRO office. Equally as important, Mrs. 
McCarty recognizes the importance of cross-tra1nmg available to advocates within her 
organization The local Sexual Assault Response Coordinator routinely responds to 
requests for training, further solidifymg the relationship between Vandenberg AFB and 
the rape crisis center Mrs. McCarty is married to a retired veteran of the United States 
Air Force. With 24 years as a military spouse as well as her 18-plus years working 
closely with Vandenberg AFB providing intervention services to military sexual assault 
victims (MSAV), Mrs. McCarty has a keen understanding of military culture Mrs. 
McCarty has a B S in Criminal Justice and an M.B.A She has been a California Coalition 
Against Sexual Assault Council member and representative for the Central Coast 
Region since 2003.

LINDA MCFARLANE
Linda McFarlane, MSW, LCSW, is JDI's Deputy Executive Director. She has worked 
with survivors of sexual violence in a variety of settings throughout the last two decades. 
Linda is the former Director of Counseling Services for the Sexual Assault Crisis Agency 
in Long Beach, California. She has served as a counselor and advocate for children and 
youth in both foster care and detention. In 1995, Linda was instrumental in 
implementing a ground-breaking treatment program for mentally ill incarcerated teen 
girls in Detroit, Michigan. She has worked in crisis intervention with a variety of 
populations including survivors of domestic violence and child abuse, teens and adults 
living with mental illness, and people living in poverty and with addictions.

TEAMA MCGREGOR



MEGAN MCKENDRY
Megan McKendry, M.P.H., is SAFER's Policy and Research Coordinator. In this role, 
she oversees SAFER and V-Day's Campus Accountability Project (CAP) database and 
is writing a forthcoming report about the state of college sexual assault policies in the 
U.S. Outside of SAFER, Megan designs and delivers sexual and relationship violence 
prevention programming at the University of Arizona . Megan earned her Master of 
Public Health from Columbia University in 2012.

FRANK MENDOZA

STEPHANIE MESONES
Stephanie, Development Associate, at East Los Angeles Women's Center, is an 
experienced anti-oppression trainer and capacity builder on violence prevention, 
community organizing, domestic and sexual violence. Since joining East LA Women’s 
Center Stephanie has collaborated on the development of a bilingual, culturally 
competent curriculum for Promotoras with a focus on violence against women issues 
and preventing sexual assault and domestic violence. Stephanie has a wealth of 
experience facilitating bilingual sexual assault and domestic violence trainings. 
Stephanie has experience mobilizing and training Latinas across California, 
empowering and motivating women and men to take a stance against violence. In 
addition, she has worked with social service providers in various communities to 
increase their awareness about violence against women, understanding of how Latinas 
may: perceive outside assistance, access community resources and respond to 
violence. Stephanie is passionate about helping organizations understand their 
stakeholder’s needs and providing culturally competent programming and services.

JESSICA MINDLIN
Jessica Mindlin is the National Director of Training and Technical Assistance for the 
Victim Rights Law Center (VRLC), a non-profit organization dedicated to transforming 
the nation’s legal response to rape and sexual assault. She is also an Adjunct Professor 
of Law. Before joining the VRLC, Jessica served as Senior Staff Attorney and a clinical 
instructor for NCVLI and Lewis and Clark Law School, statewide Support Unit Attorney 
for Legal Aid Services of Oregon, Coordinator of the Oregon Supreme Court-Oregon 
State Bar Task Force on Gender Fairness, and Legal Access Project Director for the 
Oregon Coalition Against Domestic and Sexual Violence. Before law school, Jessica 
worked as a rape victim advocate, a counselor and legal advocate for battered women, 
a counselor for runaway teens, and a waitress. (She also spent a year as a farmer on 
an Oregon commune.) Jessica serves on the Editorial Board of the Sexual Assault 
Report and the Board of Directors for the Oregon Attorney General’s Sexual Assault 
Task Force. She is a founding member of CounterQuo, a national campaign to change 
the status quo on how we examine and respond to sexual assault.



SANTA MOLINA-MARSHALL
Santa Molina-Marshall has been employed as the Director of Counseling and Advocacy 
at the DC Rape Crisis Center since 2007. She manages the Center’s counseling 
program; ensures that relevant grant objectives and expenditures are adhered to; 
provides individual and group counseling; directs program development; and supervises 
clinical staff and graduate social work students. Prior to her employment with the Center 
Ms. Molina managed her private psychotherapy practice; served as “Lifeline for Kids” 
Project Coordinator for the Center for Adoption Support and Education, Inc.; worked as 
an Adoptions Social Worker for Child and Family Services Agency; served as Clinical 
Director at Sanctuary for Families, Inc., a domestic violence organization in NYC; and 
has presented at numerous National and International conferences and trainings on 
Women and Trauma. Ms. Molina received her BS and her MSW from Hunter College in 
NYC. She has obtained licensure/certification as a Somatic Experiencing Practitioner, 
Massage Therapist, Integral Yoga Teacher, Reiki Master and was ordained as an 
Interfaith Minister at the New Seminary in New York City. Ms. Molina specializes on 
issues of Addiction, loss and grief, bereavement, adult and childhood sexual abuse. She 
has been providing services for the last 20 years. She developed a holistic approach to 
addressing the needs of survivors of trauma that encompass addressing the 
neurobiological effects of trauma and honors the healing process of the body, mind and 
spirit. Ms. Molina is a compassionate, dedicated clinician and administrator. She 
believes that we all have the innate ability to be whole, happy and enlightened.

MARI MORALES-WILLIAMS
Born in East Harlem and raised in the Bronx, Mari is an activist scholar whose work 
focuses on rape culture, media literacy, and community based education. Her 
dissertation, "Tough Love: Young Urban Women of Color and Their Lessons on Race, 
Gender, and Sexuality," won the Myra Sadker Foundation Dissertation Award for its 
potential to change gender inequity within education. She is the Education Strategist of 
FAAN, a critical media literacy activist organization based in Philadelphia. She identifies 
as a Black Puerto Rican queer rape survivor dancer poet warrior, and is committed to 
the healing and liberation of our communities.

BILLYE JONES MULRAINE
Billye Jones Mulraine, LCSW is the Assistant Executive Director of Clinical Programs at 
Kingsbridge Heights Community Center. Billye has been at the center for nine years, 
serving as the Assistant Director of KHCC’s Parent and Child (PAC) Program from 
2004-2007, Director of the Child Sexual Abuse Treatment and Prevention Program 
(CSA) from 2007-2010. Previously she served at the Center for Preventive Psychiatry 
as staff psychotherapist for children and adolescents. Billye has extensive experience 
working with sexually abused/sexually aggressive youth. Ms. Jones-Mulraine has an 
MSW degree from New York University. Billye is an active member of the National 
Association of Social Workers (NASW) where she current holds a local and a National 
position.



MICHAEL MUNSON
michael munson is the co-founder and Executive Director of FORGE, an organization 
focused on improving the lives of transgender individuals by building stronger 
connections, providing resources, and empowering growth through knowledge. His 
educational background is in psychology, with an emphasis in trauma. Munson's work 
on violence against transgender and gender non-conforming individuals is 
groundbreaking, stressing the intersectionality between complex components of identity, 
experience, and societal constructs that can both spur violence, as well as catalyze 
healing for individuals and communities. He is passionate about engaging professionals 
to embrace these complexities and learn key skills to better serve their clients/
constituents.

DEREK MURRAY
Derek Murray, MPA, serves as Program Director at JDI. Prior to joining JDI he worked 
as Administrative Coordinator for a small non-profit organization serving the gay and 
transgender community in Hollywood and West Hollywood. Derek has extensive 
volunteer experience, including at the Los Angeles Gay and Lesbian Center, Minority 
AIDS Project, and Bienestar. He is a UCLA graduate and received his Master's of Public 
Administration from California State University, Northridge.

REBECCA NAGLE
Rebecca Nagle is the co-founder and co-director of FORCE: Upsetting Rape Culture. 
FORCE: Upsetting Rape Culture is a creative activist effort to upset the culture of rape 
and promote a culture of consent. We believe that a more difficult and honest 
conversation needs to happen in America to face the realities of sexual violence, and 
we envision a world where sex is empowering and pleasurable rather than coercive and 
violent. To promote this needed conversation, FORCE creates art actions to generate 
media attention and get millions of people talking. According to the Huffington Post, 
“Force is doing a good and creative job with a hard-to-digest topic, capturing the public 
imagination with their tactics.” Their creative tactics have also been praised in the New 
York Daily News, New York Magazine, Jezebel, The Nation, and Bitch to name a few. In 
between the media buzz, FORCE is also building a movement on the ground by 
creating spaces for conversation, facilitating community workshops, and partnering with 
other national organizations. FORCE is led by feminist duo Hannah Brancato and 
Rebecca Nagle. Brancato and Nagle are both community organizers, activists, and 
artists who teach and work throughout Baltimore.

KIMBER J. NICOLETTI
Kimber J. Nicoletti, MSW, Director and Founder of Multicultural Efforts to end Sexual 
Assault (MESA) at Purdue University, has been an advocate for Latina, Migrant Farm 
Worker and Multicultural communities for over 20 years. Ms. Nicoletti works at the 
national, state and local level engaging communities and organizations in the use of 
culturally relevant models for promoting healing, healthy relationships and preventing 
sexual violence. Ms. Nicoletti has helped in the development of several fotonovelas and 
guidebooks on sexual violence prevention in farm worker communities. As a clinician 
and a prevention practitioner, she has developed a successful model of sexual violence 



prevention for the migrant farm worker and Latina/o immigrant communities. In 2007, 
Kimber created Mujeres del Movimiento, a national resource and support group for 
Latina women who work in violence prevention. Kimber who brings a high level of 
energy and enthusiasm to her work has a positive attitude and is skilled at using an 
arts-based approach for engaging communities. Her experiences as a survivor of 
domestic and sexual violence and a bilingual therapist provide her with insight into 
barriers and challenges in creating culturally relevant services. Ms. Nicoletti has worked 
as a consultant with many organizations including Centers for Disease Control and 
Prevention, OVW, Praxis International, National Sexual Violence Resource Center, 
Southern Poverty Law Center, California Rural Legal Assistance and the U.S. 
Department of Army. Ms. Nicoletti formerly served the chair for the Advisory Council of 
the National Sexual Violence Resource Center and also as the president of the Purdue 
Latino Faculty and Staff Association for 5 years and currently serves as the President 
Emeritus. She is also the advisor to several student organizations. Ms. Nicoletti was 
awarded the 2013 Woman of Distinction award at the YWCA Salute to Women.

KLARISSA OH
Klarissa Oh is a founding member and the Executive Director of OAASIS, Oregon 
Abuse Advocates and Survivors in Service. Prior to OAASIS, she worked as Director of 
the Maternal Infant Health Integrator with BH1, as a Family Assessment Worker with 
Healthy Start, and as a Group Facilitator with Kids' Turn, a program that equips children 
during divorce and custody changes. Klarissa's work has focused on children's and 
women's health, child development, poverty alleviation, and social justice. What draws 
Klarissa to this work is her core belief that each person is sacred and has immeasurable 
worth. Klarissa received a BA from Wheaton College and a Master's of Theological 
Studies from Vanderbilt Divinity School.

JULIA PARISH
Julia Parish is an attorney with the Work and Family and SURVIVE (Surviving Violence 
and Increasing Viable Employment) Projects at the Legal Aid Society – Employment 
Law Center. Julia provides legal advice, know-your-rights workshops, and direct legal 
services for workers struggling with family and medical crises, domestic violence, and 
sexual assault. Julia works on policy initiatives at both the local and state level to 
improve protections for survivors of violence. She has partnered with service providers 
around the state to make legal services accessible and client-centered, and been 
trained as a domestic violence counselor. Julia received her J.D. from the University of 
California, Berkeley in 2011. Prior to Law School, Julia was a High School Spanish 
teacher and sports coach.

WENDY L. PATRICK
Wendy L. Patrick is a San Diego County Deputy District Attorney named by her peers as 
one of the Top Ten criminal attorneys in San Diego by the San Diego Daily Transcript. 
She has completed over 150 trials ranging from hate crimes, to domestic violence, to 
first-degree murder. In her current assignment in the Sex Crimes and Stalking Division 
of the San Diego County District Attorney’s Office, Ms. Patrick prosecutes sexually 
violent predators, human traffickers, stalkers, rapists, and child molesters. She is the 



Team Leader in charge of the Sexually Violent Predator cases her office handles, and 
Co-Chair of the statewide California District Attorneys Association Sexually Violent 
Predator Committee and the Human Trafficking Committee. Ms. Patrick speaks to 
community groups, law enforcement organizations, and a wide variety of legal and 
educational institutions about the prevalence and methodology of human traffickers, 
sexual predators, and stalkers, and how to increase public awareness and take steps to 
protect the community. Ms. Patrick is an Institute of Criminal Investigation certified 
instructor for law enforcement and has lectured nationally and internationally on the 
topics of sexual abuse, domestic violence, and child molestation. She received the 
SART Response With a Heart Award based on her significant contribution to the 
professional field of sexual assault prosecution in 2011.

EZAK PEREZ
Ezak Perez is an LA-born-and-raised queer, trans, Latino, Two-Spirit, Hopi/First Nations 
community organizer and activist. Ezak currently works as the Campaign Director with 
Gender Justice LA, an organization that works to elevate the collective voice and power 
of the transgender & gender non-conforming community in Los Angeles, through 
grassroots organizing and leadership development. They are a proud Brown Boi Project 
member, Big Boy Vintage model, an advisory board member for the first annual Queer 
Latin@ Film Festival, LDiR (Leadership Development in Interethnic Relations) Facilitator 
for Health & Wellness as well as an alumnus & Facilitator of Facilitation for Social 
Change, and a former Americorps Fellow and Mark Taper Fellow with Public Allies. Ezak 
is a performer with the Local Autonomy Networks (Autonets), which is a project focused 
on creating networks of communication to increase community autonomy and reduce 
violence against women, LGBTQI people, people of color and other groups who 
continue to survive violence on a daily basis. Ezak also works as a sex educator with 
Cucci, a sex educators collective in LA that works towards sexual health justice and is 
very passionate about fighting for social change around multiple issues that intersect 
with the lack of health access and alternative responses to violence in low-income, 
LGBTQI and people of color communities.

Liliana T. Pérez is a longtime community activist in the Immigrant, Latino and Lesbian, 
Gay, Bisexual and Transgender community for over 17 years. As the community 
organizer for the National Association of Latino Elected and Appointed Officials 
(NALEO) Educational Fund, she coordinated workshops for thousands of applicants 
seeking the American dream to become a U.S. citizen. In 1995, Liliana served as an 
assistant to Assembly Speaker Emeritus, Antonio R. Villaraigosa for five years. 
Following her service with Villaraigosa, Liliana became a Community Investment Officer 
for the United Way of Greater Los Angeles. In 2001, Liliana became Director of 
Volunteer Outreach and Special Projects for Villaraigosa for Mayor in Los Angeles. 
Liliana coordinated a volunteer base of 1,200 for five field offices. Shortly thereafter, she 
was appointed as the Special Assistant & Spanish Language Media Liaison for 
Governor Gray Davis and proudly served in his Administration until his retirement from 
office. She then humbly accepted the role as the District Director for the Speaker of the 
Assembly Fabián Núñez for the 46th Assembly District. During that same period, she 



was privileged to have volunteered for the historic and successful 2005 election of 
Antonio R. Villaraigosa as Mayor of the City of Los Angeles. In 2007, Mayor Villaraigosa 
appointed Ms. Pérez to serve as a Commissioner for the Commission on the Status of 
Women for the City of Los Angeles. She also serves as a Board member for 
Bienestar (one of the largest non-profit social service organizations in Southern 
California, dedicated to positively impacting the health and well-being of the Latino 
community and other underserved communities) and the Los Angeles Theater Academy 
(a performing arts after-school program for children of all ages). Ms. Pérez has proudly 
served in four Speakership administrations: Antonio R. Villaraigosa, Fabián Núñez, 
Karen Bass and now longtime labor and Democratic party leader, John A. Pérez, where 
she serves as the Special Assistant to the Speaker working on policy issues and special 
projects that aim to improve job creation, livable wages, affordable and accessible 
health care.

BECKY PERKINS
As the Statewide Outreach Manager for the Ohio Alliance to End Sexual Violence 
(OAESV), Becky’s role is to assist survivors and victim service agencies throughout 
Ohio through training, technical assistance, dissemination of best practices and policy 
development. Prior to coming to OAESV, Becky worked briefly for a consulting business 
providing grant-writing and project support for a variety of nonprofit organizations. Becky 
worked for seven years for the Butler County Rape Crisis Program in Oxford, Ohio, 
providing program and grant management, volunteer supervision and program 
development. Under her leadership, the program received the Promising Practice Award 
from the Ohio Attorney General for groundbreaking work with Butler County’s Latino 
population, and Becky received a partnership award from the Miami University Police 
Department for consulting on improvements to the departmental response to student 
survivors. Becky has provided over 600 contacts to survivors of sexual assault, and she 
has trained and supervised over 200 volunteers. She possesses Bachelor’s degrees in 
Psychology and Health Promotion, and possesses Certification in the Management of 
Volunteer Programs. As a survivor of rape, Becky is passionate about eliminating sexual 
violence and ensuring that all survivors have the resources they need for recovery.

BRAD PERRY
Brad worked at the Virginia Sexual & Domestic Violence Action Alliance (VSDVAA) from 
2000-2011 after starting JMU’s first all-male sexual assault prevention group in 1999. 
In his role as statewide Sexual Violence Prevention Coordinator for VSDVAA, he 
provided training and technical assistance to primary prevention initiatives throughout 
Virginia and edited the Moving Upstream newsletter. He currently sits on the national 
board of Hollaback!, and has authored articles published in Yes Means Yes, The 
Prevention Researcher, and Violence Against Women. Brad is currently a sexual 
violence prevention consultant, and works fulltime for branding agency, Create Digital. 
He plays drums in a punk band on No Idea Records, and loves cooking with his wife 
(Tara) and burping his son (Oliver) in beautiful Richmond, VA. 
Peter Pollard, the Communication and Professional Outreach director for 1in6, has 
worked for more than 20 years as a social worker, sexual abuse and domestic violence 
prevention specialist and survivor advocate. He was previously Public Education 



director and Helpline Supervisor at Stop It Now! and worked for 15 years as a state 
child protection case manager. He also works as a group leader for a Certified Batterers  
Intervention Program. Since 2003, he has served as the director of the Western 
Massachusetts Chapter of SNAP (Survivors Network of those Abused by Priests). His 
comments about child abuse and community responsibility for prevention have been 
published in the Boston Globe, on National Public Radio, CNN, and WBUR Boston.

ROB POWELL
Rob Powell is the Member Services Coordinator with the North Carolina Coalition 
Against Sexual Assault. For the past three years, Rob has worked to provide training 
and support to rape crisis centers throughout North Carolina. Prior to joining the 
NCCASA team, Rob worked as the Rape Prevention Education Coordinator with the 
Family Violence and Rape Crisis Services in Chatham County. Rob has a degree from 
Berry College in Communication and Women's Studies.

JEN PRZEWOZNIK
Jen Przewoznik, MSW, is a trainer, technical assistance provider, practitioner and 
program evaluator with over 15 years of experience working with/in women’s and 
LGBTQI communities. She is founder of the Queer Research Consulting Collaborative, 
a project designed to provide consultation to researchers who are studying LGBTQI 
experiences and identities. Jen is currently the Director of Prevention and Evaluation at 
the North Carolina Coalition Against Sexual Assault (NCCASA) where she provides 
training and technical assistance to organizations and college campuses working on 
sexual violence prevention efforts. She also co-chairs the NC State Sexual Violence 
Prevention Team and the NC Campus Consortium. While Jen is a proud born and 
raised New Jersey-ite, she currently lives in Durham, NC with her partner and many 
rescued animals.

PROJECT SISTER FAMILY SERVICES
Project Sister Family Services (PSFS) is the only California state-designated provider of 
sexual assault crisis and prevention services in a 27-city region located eastern Los 
Angeles and western San Bernardino Counties. The mission of PSFS is to reduce the 
trauma and risk of sexual assault and child abuse. 
www.projectsister.org

ANDREA QUIJADA
With more than a decade of experience as a media literacy trainer, and 20 years as a 
community organizer, Andrea has a deep passion for media justice. She presents 
nationally and internationally on the impact of media on culture, politics, and technology, 
serves on the Leadership Team of the national Media Action Grassroots Network, and is 
a 2010 alum of Women’s Media Center Progressive Women’s Voices. She is an 
advisory board member of Generation Justice, serves as an advisor to Enlace 
Comunitario, and is a volunteer with IMPACT Personal Safety New Mexico. She has co-
founded various organizations in Albuquerque, including Young Women United, a 
reproductive justice organization by and for young women of color. She is particularly 
interested in media as a tool for self-determination and movement building. Andrea has 

http://www.projectsister.org/
http://www.projectsister.org/


strong cultural and community ties to the Southwest. Originally from Phoenix, Arizona, 
she has happily made New Mexico her home for the past 17 years. Andrea earned her 
M.A. in Art History from the University of New Mexico with a focus on Chicana feminist 
art and art of social movements.

NANCY RADCLIFFE
Ms. Radcliffe is the Director of Sexual Assault Services for HelpLine and has been an 
advocate and educator in the field of Violence Against Women for approximately twenty 
four years. She has taught girls ‘and women’s self-defense for approximately twenty 
years and is a certified self-defense instructor through the National Women’s Martial 
Arts Federation. Ms. Radcliffe began working as a volunteer for the local rape crisis 
center, began studying/teaching self-defense, while getting her undergraduate degree in 
Sociology with an emphasis in Gender Studies. Prior to coming to HelpLine, Ms. 
Radcliffe was the Campus Advocacy Program Coordinator for The Ohio State 
University. In that position, Ms. Radcliffe provided advocacy for students, staff and 
faculty who had experienced intimate partner abuse, stalking, sexual harassment and 
sexual assault. Also, while at Ohio State, she taught women’s self-defense and taught a 
similar course at Denison University, as well. Prior to that position, Ms. Radcliffe worked 
in a similar capacity for the Sexual Assault Response Network of Central Ohio 
(SARNCO), central Ohio’s rape crisis center. Much of her work in the anti-violence field 
has included: providing direct service to victims/survivors, providing prevention 
programming, training for professionals, and collaborating with agencies on various 
projects.

SANGEETHA RAVICHANDRAN
Girl/Friends After school Coordinator, A Long Walk Home, Inc. 

ERICA RICH
Erica Rich is the Training Specialist for the Sexual Assault across the Lifespan National 
Technical Assistance project (Lifespan project) at the National Sexual Violence 
Resource Center. In this position she helps in the efforts of the agency to provide 
support for law enforcement, prosecutors, health personnel and advocates in how best 
to stay trauma focused in their service delivery. Prior to working for the NSVRC, Erica 
was the Youth Program Coordinator for Planned Parenthood of Central PA, where she 
directed two youth groups—a Peer Education program and an LGBT youth group and 
provided evidence-based sexuality education throughout the community. She is 
involved in several leadership and community service organizations and is passionate 
about fighting for social justice. Erica earned a Bachelor of Science degree from 
Western Michigan University, with a major in Psychology and a minor in Women’s 
Studies.

CARMEN RIOS
Carmen Rios is a writer and activist currently based out of Washington, DC. She’s been 
working professionally and under the table in feminism since 2008, and plans to do so 
for the rest of her life. Very much so 22, Carmen graduated from American University in 
2012 with a degree in Women’s Studies and Communication, and contributes regularly 



to Autostraddle, PolicyMic, and the SPARK Movement blog about queer liberation, 
gender equality, and racial and socioeconomic justice. She also edits the blog for THE 
LINE Campaign, wrangling bloggers of all ages and backgrounds to create a world 
without rape. In the past, she’s worked on social media and web-based organizing, 
community-building, and fundraising for Hollaback!, the Feminist Majority Foundation, 
the Domestic Violence Resource Project, the Institute for Women’s Policy Research, 
and the AU Women & Politics Institute. Most of Carmen’s work focuses specifically on 
issues of rape, consent, and sex-positivity, combining a theoretical framework with the 
real world to achieve tangible change. She launched a successful peer-to-peer 
educational campaign at American University and later ran their women’s organization, 
Women’s Initiative, where she successfully raised over $20,000 for various causes and 
organized an array of events around women’s needs. She also implemented policy 
changes meant to directly combat sexual assault rates and occurrences on her campus.  
Carmen is absolutely crazy about her dog, Eli, and hates paying more than one dollar 
for a good slice of pizza. You can follow her on Twitter (@C-rios) and Tumblr.

BAMBY SALCEDO
Bamby Salcedo is a Mexican native trans woman. She is the HIV Prevention Services 
Project Coordinator with Children’s Hospital Los Angeles. Bamby is the founder and 
President of the Trans-Latin@ Coalition, a national advocacy organization to address 
the needs of trans Latina immigrant women residing in the United States. She has 
served in various planning groups and organizations, such as the CHPG (California HIV 
Planning Group) in which she chaired the transgender working group. Bamby is also the 
former Co-Chair for the 
Transgender Task Force with the Prevention Planning Committee of Los Angeles 
County, a member of the National Latino AIDS Action Network (NLAAN), and a board 
member for the National Latino LGBT Civil Rights Organization Unid@s. Bamby is 
currently working with the Pan-American Health Organization (PAHO) developing a 
blueprint on how to provide competent health care services for trans people in Latin 
America and the Caribbean. One of Bamby’s accomplishments is producing the very 
first trans youth calendar, Angels 
of Change, through which she has created a positive media outlet for images of trans 
youth. Bamby has also spoken at various national conferences including the United 
Conference on AIDS, where she was asked to be an opening plenary speaker in 2009 
and in 2012. She has been recognized nationwide for her advocacy work related to 
trans issues. In 2006 she was given the Sol Award at the National Latino AIDS 
Awareness Day of Los Angeles; in 2009 she was honored with the Icon Award from 
TransUnity Pride Los Angeles; in 2010 she was recognized by Christopher Street West, 
Producers of LA Pride, with the Connie Norman Leadership Award for her leadership in 
trans communities; in 2011 she was awarded the Sheila J. Kuehl Trailblazer Award from 
the Stone Wall Democratic Club; and in 2012 she was awarded the City of West 
Hollywood Women in Leadership Award and the Good Neighbor Award by State Farm 
Insurance and the L.A. Gay and Lesbian Center.

SHARON SHELTON
Senior Director, Empowerment Services, YWCA of Greater Los Angeles



VICKEI T. SIDES
Vickie R. Sides is originally from Benton Harbor, Michigan but has lived in Chicago 
since she was 18 months old. She is the past Associate Director of the Center for Racial 
Justice and Activism at YWCA Metropolitan Chicago, where she also served as the 
founding Coordinator of the Chicago Rape Crisis Hotline during her 12-year tenure with 
the agency. Vickie currently serves as Director of Resources for Sexual Violence 
Prevention, a campus anti-violence program at the University of Chicago. She is an 
Adjunct instructor at City Colleges Chicago and National-Louis University in Chicago. 
Vickie has spent several years working in the movement to end violence against 
women. She is dedicated to using education to advance an understanding of the 
connections between inequality and violence as central to that work. As an educator, 
she is committed to educating for social justice and is active in local and national 
movements for justice and equity in both her personal and professional work. Vickie 
earned an undergraduate degree from Chicago State University and an M.A. from 
DePaul University. She lives in the Chicago area with her Partner and her college-aged 
Nephew, whom they have raised together for the past fifteen years.

TERRA SLAVIN
Lead Staff Attorney, L.A. Gay & Lesbian Center

TYANNA SLOBE
Tyanna is a graduate student in Linguistics at The University of Colorado at 
Boulder. She is especially interested in trans* issues, linguistics, immigration, law, 
media studies, education, and when girls tell the world who they are instead of the world 
telling us who we are. Tweet at her at https://twitter.com/#!/TySlobe.
HEIDI (BOA) SMITH
Just Detention International

LEONA SMITH DI FAUSTINO
Leona Smith Di Faustino, L.C.S.W. is the Training and Technical Assistance Coordinator 
at the California Coalition Against Sexual Assault. Leona has always had a passion for 
social justice work. This passion has translated into a decades worth of work in the field 
of sexual violence and relationship violence intervention and prevention. Leona firmly 
believes that ending interpersonal violence for the individual, the community and society 
is both a daunting task but one that is possible if not in her life time but in the future for 
the next generations. Leona is the host of PreventConnect's Ending Child Sexual Abuse 
web conference series.

RACHEL SOLOV
District Attorney, San Diego District Attorney's Office; President, Association of Threat 
Assessment Professionals

ESMERELDA SOTO

LOVISA STANNOW



Just Detention International

LARRINITA STARKS
Girl/Friends Alumna, A Long Walk Home

BETTE STEBBINS INCH
Bette Stebbins Inch is the Senior Victim Assistance Advisor for the Department of 
Defense, Sexual Assault Prevention and Response Office. She is a subject matter 
expert on crime victim care in the military jurisdiction and has 17 years experience 
serving military crime victims. Ms. Inch holds a Masters of Science Degree, in 
Counseling Psychology from Chaminade University, Hawaii, and a Bachelors of Art 
Degree, Cum Laude, in Psychology from Hawaii Pacific University. She also holds a 
paralegal certification from Brigham Young University. Ms. Inch is a trained Department 
of the Army Inspector General, and a Credentialed Advanced Advocate with the 
designation of Comprehensive Victim Intervention Specialist from the National Advocate 
Credentialing Program. Prior to joining the Sexual Assault Prevention and Response 
Office in 2007, Ms. Inch served as the senior victim specialist on two Congressionally 
mandated Defense Task Forces: Sexual Assault in the Military Services and Sexual 
Harassment & Violence at the Military Service Academies. She also served as the 
victim-witness assistance program manager and paralegal for nearly ten years with the 
Office of the Staff Judge Advocate, 25th Infantry Division, Hawaii. Ms. Inch is an expert 
in crime victims’ rights and she is a national speaker on victim care in the military and an 
adjunct professor. She led the Department of Defense in several ground-breaking 
initiatives, to include, the development of the DoD Safe Helpline, the nation’s first 
confidential hotline resource for military victims of sexual assault, and the award-
winning Safe Helpline mobile app, the nation’s first sexual assault response app, and 
the Safe HelpRoom, a secure moderated online peer support forum; the Department’s 
first sexual assault advocate certification program for individuals providing direct 
assistance to military victims of sexual assault; and Department-wide standards for all 
victim assistance-related services. Ms. Inch has received numerous awards over the 
years to include Federal Employee of the Year for the U.S. Army, Pacific Region, Letter 
of Commendation from the Under Secretary of Defense for Personnel and Readiness, 
and Award for Excellence from the Secretary of Defense. She currently serves as an 
advisor to several national organizations assisting military victims of crime, such as the 
National Victim Assistance Standards Consortium, and as a council member on the 
congressionally-mandated U.S. Peace Corps Sexual Assault Advisory Council.

NAN STEIN
For over 30 years, Nan Stein has conducted research on sexual harassment in K-12 
schools and teen dating violence. A former middle school teacher, drug and alcohol 
counselor, and gender equity specialist with the Massachusetts Department of 
Education(1978-1992), she has collaborated with teachers' unions and sexual assault/
domestic violence agencies throughout the US. She has authored many book chapters, 
law review and academic journals as well as commentaries for the mainstream media 
and the educational press, and often serves as an expert witness in Title IX/sex 
discrimination-sexual harassment lawsuits in K-12 schools. Since 1992 when she joined 



the Center for Research on Women at Wellesley College, the largest and oldest 
women's research center in the US, as a senior research scientist, her research 
portfolio has been funded by the US Department of Education, National Institute of 
Justice, Centers for Disease Control and Prevention, the Open Society Institute of the 
Soros Foundation, and other private family foundations. In 2007, she received the 
Outstanding Contribution to Education award from the Harvard University Graduate 
School of Education where she received her doctorate of education in 1981.

LAURA STEMPLE
Director of Graduate Studies, UCLA School of Law

GAIL STERN
Dr. Gail Stern has over 20 years of experience in violence prevention education and 
advocacy. She is the co-owner and Chief Academic Officer of Catharsis Productions, 
and is the co-author and co-producer of SEX SIGNALS, which is presented hundreds of 
times at universities and military installations each year. Dr. Stern served as a subject 
matter expert (SME) and trainer for the U.S. Air Force-wide Bystander Intervention 
initiative; co-developed a 20-hour peer education program on sexual violence 
prevention for the USNA; and serves as an instructional leader in Catharsis Productions  
prevention initiative at Naval Station Great Lakes. Dr. Stern serves as a SME to the U.S. 
Air Force, the U.S. Army, the U.S. Navy, the U.S Marine Corps, U.S. National Guard, 
and is a highly sought-after speaker at national and regional sexual and domestic 
violence prevention conferences. Dr. Stern is the co-creator of the Force of Awesome 
Institute, a training program for violence prevention educators that incorporates her 
research on using humor to reduce emotional and cognitive resistance to challenging 
issues. Dr. Stern served as the director of the University of Illinois at Chicago (UIC) 
Campus Advocacy Network from 1991-1998, providing crisis counseling and court 
advocacy to victims of violence.

JULIA STRANGE
For over ten years, Julia Strange has worked to end gender-based violence, including 
intimate partner violence and sexual assault through direct victim advocacy, outreach, 
education, and public policy advocacy at the local and federal level. She is currently the 
Director of Programs and Policy for Collective Action for Safe Spaces (CASS), a 
volunteer-led and -run organization that aims to empower the Washington DC 
metropolitan area to build communities free from public sexual harassment and assault. 
She also addresses sexual assault in the military as a Program Analyst for the Navy’s 
Sexual Assault Prevention and Response (SAPR) program. Prior to coming to DC, Julia 
served as a Peace Corps volunteer in Uzbekistan.

TRISTAN SVARE
Tristan Svare is a Deputy District Attorney from the Elder & Dependent Adult Abuse 
Prosecution section of the Family Violence Unit in the San Bernardino County District 
Attorney's Office in California. Tristan joined the San Bernardino County District 
Attorney’s Office in 1996. He began working in the High Desert area, prosecuting all 
manner of misdemeanor and felony cases before specializing in domestic violence, 



sexual assault and child abuse cases. For the past ten years or more he has 
prosecuted cases of elder and dependent adult abuse - including assault, theft, abuse, 
neglect, sexual assault, embezzlement, and murder. In October 2005, Tristan became a 
Lead Deputy District Attorney for the Office’s Family Violence Unit, where he 
coordinated the efforts of a team of child abuse, sexual assault, domestic violence and 
elder abuse prosecutors. He continues as a senior Deputy District Attorney, addressing 
prosecution of elder abuse and abuse of persons with disabilities, while also addressing 
policy and training issues in this area.
In June of 2013, Tristan Svare was promoted to Supervising Deputy District Attorney, 
where he now oversees the Office’s Special Units. Tristan is an expert in elder abuse 
prosecutions, presenting trainings to state and local prosecutors, police and sheriff’s 
departments, medical, financial, and social services providers and agencies across 
California, and across the nation. 

AMITA SWADHIN
Amita Swadhin is the Los Angeles Executive Director of Peer Health Exchange, a 
national nonprofit that gives teens the knowledge and skills to make healthy decisions 
by training college student volunteers to teach a comprehensive health curriculum in 
low-income public high schools lacking health education. Prior to joining Peer Health 
Exchange in May 2012, Amita served as the Coordinator and a cast member of Secret 
Survivors, a theater project she conceived of in 2009 for the NYC-based off-off 
Broadway Ping Chong & Co. featuring survivors of child sexual abuse telling their 
stories. She previously held positions in New York City nonprofits and public institutions, 
including Kingsborough Community College (CUNY), Make the Road NY, Global Kids 
and Legal Momentum, served as the Board Chair of the National Youth Advocacy 
Coalition, and served as a consultant to a number of foundations, nonprofits and 
schools. Amita is the co-host of Flip the Script, a weekly radio show on KPFK-LA, a 
member of the Peace Over Violence Child Sexual Abuse Prevention Advisory Council, a 
member of the Liberty Hill Foundation’s OUT Fund, a founding member of South Asians 
for Justice, and enjoys writing poetry and essays in her spare time. She holds a B.S. in 
Foreign Service from Georgetown University and an M.P.A. from the NYU Wagner

ZOSIA SZTYKOWSKI
Zosia Sztykowski has been organizing her community in Washington, DC to build safe 
public and private spaces for women and LGBTQ individuals for over two years. She 
serves as the Director of Community Outreach for Collective Action for Safe Spaces, an 
organization that fights public sexual harassment and assault, and as a Program 
Assistant for the National Judicial Education Program of Legal Momentum. She studied 
political science and international relations at Tufts University, where she focused her 
studies on human rights and social justice.

JOAN TABACHNICK
Joan Tabachnick is nationally recognized for her expertise in sexual violence prevention 
and social marketing. Over the past 20 years, she has developed award winning 
educational materials and innovative programs for a wide variety of national, state and 
local organizations and asked to participate on national expert panels for a variety of 



organizations including the Centers for Disease Control and Prevention, National Center 
for Missing and Exploited Children and the Unitarian Universalist Association. Her most 
recent work includes a National Sexual Violence Resource publication titled “Engaging 
Bystanders in Sexual Violence Prevention” and a publication through the Association for 
the Treatment of Sexual Abusers called “A Reasoned Approach: The Reshaping of Sex 
Offender Policy to Prevent Child Sexual Abuse”. Together with Cordelia Anderson, Joan 
is a lead presenter for the PreventConnect/Ms. Foundation for Women Ending Child 
Sexual Abuse web conference series.

FARAH TANIS
Executive Director, Black Women's Blueprint

LAURAN TAYLOR
Lauren Taylor is lead instructor of Defend Yourself, which teaches skills for stopping 
harassment, abuse, and assault. She started working on gender-based violence in 1978 
(with the founding of DC's first shelter for battered women and their children and with 
DC's first take back the night march), and she hasn't stopped since. Since 1987 she has 
taught thousands of women, teens, and children in the DC area from all walks of life. 
Lauren specializes in classes for women, for people with disabilities, for LBGTQ people, 
and for survivors of abuse and assault. This year she joined with Collective Action for 
Safe Space to develop Safe Bars.

SCHEHERAZADE TILLET
Scheherazade Tillet, MAAT, is the co-founder and executive director of A Long Walk 
Home, Inc. (ALWH). Since 1998, she has been committed to creating a national 
platform that speaks out against sexual violence against women and girls. Upon 
graduating from Tufts University with her B.A. in Child Psychology and a minor in Fine 
Arts from the School of the Museum of Fine Arts in Boston in 2000, Scheherazade 
began Story of a Rape Survivor (SOARS), the first of its kind and award wining multi-
media performance which intimately examines her sister’s healing from sexual assault. 
In 2003, SOARS became the flagship program for A Long Walk Home, Inc., and 
Scheherazade has toured SOARS at over 150 colleges and universities. Moreover, 
Scheherazade’s SOARS photographs are featured in two award-winning human rights 
documentaries, “NO! The Rape Documentary” and “Rape Is…” After establishing her 
reputation as a young feminist leader through SOARS, Scheherazade earned her 
Masters in Art Therapy from the prestigious School of the Art Institute of Chicago (SAIC) 
in 2003. When Scheherazade graduated from SAIC, she began working as an art 
therapist at Chicago’s leading organization to end sexual violence, the YWCA of 
Metropolitan Chicago. Scheherazade was the only rape crisis counselor in the Westside 
of Chicago, serving neighborhoods that have the third highest sexual assaults and 
homicide rates in Illinois.

SARAH TOFTE
Sarah Tofte is an expert on criminal justice responses to violence against women and 
girls, including the rape kit backlog in the United States. Before she began work at the 



Joyful Heart Foundation, she was a senior researcher for Human Rights Watch, where 
she published reports on the rape kit backlogs in Los Angeles and Illinois.

PATRICIA TORRES
Patricia Torres is a Xican@ urban planner-poet, forging places of presence and vision 
with intergenerational cis-gendered women, gender-variant peoples, and cis-gendered 
girls of color. She is currently developing an experiential place-based educational 
program, called Love in the Time of Xican@ Feminisms, exploring eros, mental health 
and physical abilities, mindfullness and poetry in everyday survival. She is also a PhD 
urban planning student at UCLA, and since 2004 has worked as founding staff, Director 
of Programs and National Trainer for Girls For A Change, an organization that uses 
experiential consciousness raising 
as a tool of antiviolence and social change. She has also been a core organizer with 
INCITE! Women of Color and Gender Non-People of Color Against Violence LA and 
Tod@s Somos Arizona, two Los Angeles based collectives working to fulfill safety and 
rights for urban residents. She received her master's degree in International Urban 
Planning at the London School of Economics, where she attended as a Rotary 
International Ambassadorial Scholar. In 2002, Patricia graduated with high honors from 
UC Berkeley with a major in Gender and 
Comparative Urban Studies, where she focused on intimacy, dialogue and gender 
relations as key sites of intervention into state sanctioned spatial and social control. For 
more Information, please visit: http://patriciatorresmuse.weebly.com/

STEPHANIE TOWNSEND
Stephanie Townsend, PhD, has worked for more than 20 years in the movement to end 
sexual violence as both a practitioner and researcher. She began by working for rape 
crisis and prevention programs in Michigan, California and Texas. During that time she 
also served on the boards of state and national coalitions. She completed her doctoral 
work in community psychology at the University of Illinois at Chicago. Her research 
focuses on community-based rape prevention programs and Sexual Assault Nurse 
Examiner programs. As a consultant, she works collaboratively with sexual assault 
programs to conduct global, national, state, and local research and evaluation projects.

KRISTIN TUCKER
Kristin Tucker is the Senior Program Manager & Coordinator of the National Training 
and Technical Assistance Program at the Northwest Network of Bisexual, Trans, 
Lesbian and Gay Survivors of Abuse, where she has worked supporting LGBTQ 
survivors of abuse since 2002. Founded in 1987 by lesbian survivors of domestic 
violence, the Northwest Network is considered a national leader in the field of violence 
and abuse in the LGBTQ communities. The Northwest Network provides direct services 
to adult & youth survivors of violence, community engagement and education, and 
training and technical assistance on a local, regional and national level. Kristin brings 
over 15 years of experience as a community organizer, advocate and educator in areas 
as diverse as domestic & sexual violence, LGBTQ issues, chemical dependency and 
racial and economic justice to her current role at the Northwest Network, where she 
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provides support, training and technical assistance to mainstream domestic & sexual 
violence service providers across the US.

ANNA ULRICH
Anna Ulrich, Esq. Enhancement Coordinator for New York County Intimate Partner 
Sexual Assault Court The Center for Court Innovation Experience in the Movement 
Against Sexual Assault My professional experience in the movement against sexual 
assault is informed by my personal experience as a childhood victim of sexual abuse. It 
was this experience, as well as the support I received in the aftermath of the abuse, that 
inspired my decision to attend law school and to work with survivors of violence. My 
professional experience in the movement against sexual assault begins in 2012 with my 
work as the project coordinator, resource coordinator, and attorney for the Intimate 
Partner Sexual Assault (“IPSA”) Court in New York County, New York. The goal of this 
specialized IPSA court is to provide enhanced services for victims of intimate partner 
sexual assault, to improve victim safety, and to increase offender accountability. In my 
capacity as project coordinator, I was responsible for implementing IPSA Court 
protocols, case identification and transfer procedures, and a referral process for victims 
and families seeking additional services. In my ongoing role as IPSA Court resource 
coordinator, I am responsible for the court’s relationships with victim service 
organizations and court-mandated offender programs and for organizing regular 
stakeholder trainings on the topic of sexual assault. As the IPSA Court attorney, I 
conduct research and draft opinions for the IPSA Court Judge in these complex and 
difficult cases.

JYOTI VENKETRAMAN
Jyoti Venketraman is the Director of Prevention and Evaluation at the New Jersey 
Coalition Against Sexual Assault where she oversees the Prevention initiatives for 
NJCASA and its collaborative partners and provides technical assistance to its program 
members on prevention and evaluation. Jyoti has 7 plus years’ experience in women's 
health issues, especially in the area of reproductive health and health policy analysis for 
women of color and is committed to a social justice frame for ending violence. She 
holds a Masters in Public Administration from NYU Robert Wagner School of Public 
Service in Health Policy and Management, and a BS in microbiology from the University 
of Pune, India. She has experience in prevention, research, data collection and 
analysis, managing data systems, qualitative and quantitative outcomes, and 
environmental scans.

SARAH VIDRINE
Chief Program Office, Prevent Child Abuse North Carolina

HECTOR VILLAGRA
Executive Director, ACLU Los Angeles

LORIS VOLLANDT
Lori Vollandt has been a champion of Health Education and Violence Prevention 
education for the past 20 years. She has co-authored a national policy on the 



Prevention of Teen Dating Violence in Partnership with the Robert Wood Johnson 
Foundation and has been called to do a congressional briefing on this important subject. 
Dr. Vollandt has worked with LAUSD leadership to adopt a district wide policy on the 
prevention, intervention and response to Teen Dating Violence. Dr. Vollandt holds a 
Doctorate in Education from University of California at Los Angeles and is also and 
adjunct professor at University of Southern California in the Rossier School of 
Education.

KARLA VIERTHALER
Karla Vierthaler is the Outreach Coordinator for the Pennsylvania Coalition Against 
Rape (PCAR). She is currently working on projects addressing sexual violence in 
populations historically underserved by the anti-sexual violence movement, with a focus 
on people with disabilities. She has worked in the anti-sexual violence movement for 
fifteen years.

MIKE L. WALTERS
Mikel L. Walters, PhD is a Behavioral Scientist in the Division of Violence Prevention at 
the National Center for Injury Prevention and Control at the Centers for Disease Control 
and Prevention (CDC). Dr. Walters currently leads the National Intimate Partner and 
Sexual Violence Survey (NISVS) and is the lead author of the recently released NISVS 
report exploring the lifetime prevalence of intimate partner violence, sexual violence and 
stalking by sexual orientation. Her research interests include intimate partner violence, 
sexual violence, teen dating violence, bullying and many other forms of violence that 
impact sexual minorities and their communities.

CARRIE WARD
Carrie Ward, M.A. is the Grants Director on ICASA’s Administrative Office staff. Since 
1996, Carrie has conducted programmatic site visits at ICASA centers and provided 
technical assistance to centers on a wide range of program areas. Carrie works with 
ICASA’s Contracts Review and Program Committees to assist new and current centers 
to navigate the membership and funding processes. Prior to joining the ICASA staff, 
Carrie was employed as an Adult Therapist at the Prairie Center Against Sexual Assault 
(formerly Rape Information and Counseling Service) in Springfield.

REBECCA WARD
Dr. Rebecca Ward, Director, Rape Victims Support Center at the Department of Health 
since 2001, RPE director, member of the Dual Coalition Against Domestic Violence and 
Sexual Assault, member of the NSVRC Advisory Council, and member of RAINN. Dr. 
Ward is also an advisor of the Secretary of the Department of Health on gender violence 
and child maltreatment.

SHARON WASCO
Co-presenter Sharon Wasco, PhD, is a community psychologist with 20 years of 
experience related to sexual assault and violence prevention. She specializes in applied 
research and program evaluation consultation including staff training, community/
capacity assessment, logic modeling, evaluation design and implementation, data 



analysis, and evaluation use. Dr. Wasco’s evaluation practice is grounded in her years 
of community work: providing crisis counseling and advocacy to rape survivors and their 
families, working with state coalitions and rape crisis centers to develop training 
programs and implement evaluation projects, and founding a multi-disciplinary 
community coalition to coordinate sexual assault services and prevention efforts.

EVETTE WASHINGTON
Parent Leader, A Long Walk Home

FAYE WASHINGTON
Faye Washington, Chief Executive Officer, YWCA of Greater Los Angeles
As Chief Executive Officer of the YWCA Greater Los Angeles, Faye Washington is a 
rainmaker in the world of non-profit. Her 32-year government track record of 
management, personnel administration, legislative and budget policy development, and 
strategic planning created the landscape for her groundbreaking tenure of leading the 
YWCA Greater Los Angeles in its mission of eliminating racism and empowering 
women. Because of the urgency of the YWCA Greater Los Angeles’ mission, 
Washington strategically pursues funding opportunities that result in multi-generational 
impact and long-term residual value for the community at large. She walks with giants 
and demands the impossible for the sake of those who have no voice or power. 
Through meticulous hard work, creative vision, audacity, and persistence, Washington 
has become known as a “game changer.” 

ROBIN J. WILSON
Robin J. Wilson is a researcher, educator, and board certified clinical 
psychologist who has worked with sexual and other offenders in a variety of 
settings for nearly 30 years. He has published and presented widely on the 
diagnosis and treatment of social and sexual psychopathology, and is the editor 
of The Forum of the Association for the Treatment of Sexual Abusers.

ISA WOLDEGUIORGUIS
Isa Woldeguiorguis is the Executive Director of The Center for Hope and Healing 
Inc(CHH), formerly known as Rape Crisis services of Greater Lowell. CHH has 
been serving victims of rape and sexual assault, educating and raising 
awareness in the greater Lowell Massachusetts area for over thirty years. Prior to 
this, Ms. Woldeguiorguis held several statewide and national roles in the 
movement to end sexual and domestic violence. From 2007-2010. she worked at 
the Massachusetts Coalition Against Sexual Assault and Domestic Violence 
(Jane Doe Inc.) as the Policy Director and then Membership Director. Prior to 
this, Ms Woldeguiorguis worked at the Department of Social Services (DSS) now 
the Department of Children and Families (DCF) in Massachusetts. She began as 
an advocate and ultimately became the Director of the Massachusetts DSS 
Domestic Violence Unit- the first such unit in the country and a national model for 
integrating domestic violence advocates in the public child welfare system. Her 



final tenure was serving as the Assistant Commissioner for Practice and Policy, 
during which time she played a role in redesigning the agency’s practice model to 
become family-centered and in building an integrated practice in substance 
abuse, mental health and domestic violence. Ms Woldeguiorguis is a well-
respected leader and national trainer in the field of children, domestic violence, 
policy and practice. Ms Woldeguiorguis is well known for her dynamic training 
style and teaching skills on these topics and for her activism in the areas of racial 
disparities. She has authored several articles on topics such as family-centered 
practice in child welfare, racial and ethnic disproportionality and immigration.

TRACY D. WRIGHT
Tracy D. Wright is the Technical Assistance Provider and Women of Color 
Leadership Project Coordinator with the North Carolina Coalition Against Sexual 
Assault (NCCASA) for the National Resource Sharing Project. Her current work 
provides technical assistance and training to 16 state and territorial sexual 
assault coalitions. In this capacity, Tracy works with national entities to create a 
coordinated response to ending sexual violence, addresses emerging issues and 
carves out initiatives specifically for women of color in the anti-sexual violence 
movement. Ms. Wright holds a BA in Mass Communications from Shaw 
University and a Masters of Science in Print Journalism from Florida Agricultural 
and Mechanical University. She was also a graduate of the North Carolina Center 
for Women in Public Service Summer Institute and most recently the America’s 
Leaders of Change Development Initiative, a competitive cohort of nonprofit 
leaders across the country sponsored by National Urban Fellows and Walmart 
Foundation.

ELLEN YIN-WYCOFF 
Ellen Yin-Wycoff joined CALCASA in 2001, and has worked in the violence 
against women/victim services field since 1985. Currently, Ellen serves as the 
Chair of the Advisory Council for the National Sexual Violence Resource Center 
and as the Vice Chair of the State Advisory Committee on Sexual Assault Victim 
Services through the Governor’s Office of Emergency Services (OES).

MIRA YUSEF
Mira Yusef, MSW, MA, Executive Director, Monsoon United Asian Women of Iowa
Mira Yusef is the co-founder and current executive director of Monsoon United Asian 
Women of Iowa. She was a December 2007 recipient of a Masters in Social Work with 
specialization on Community Organizing and a Masters in Southeast Asian Studies from 
the University of Michigan, Ann Arbor.

SARA ZATZ
Sara Zatz is the Associate Director of Ping Chong + Company, a New York City-
based theater company that addresses important cultural and civic issues with 
artistic innovation and social integrity. At Ping Chong + Company Sara oversees 
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the community-based oral history project known as the Undesirable Elements 
series. Working in collaboration with partner organizations ranging from regional 
theaters to community-based arts organizations, she has managed the 
production of nearly two dozen original works in the series around the country, 
exploring themes such as the experiences of people with disabilities, immigrants 
and refugees, and disenfranchised youth. She has interviewed hundreds of 
individuals from all over the world, authored numerous productions in the series, 
and edited a book on the series for Theatre Communications Group. She served 
as the writer and director of the original Secret Survivors production, focusing on 
the experiences of survivors of childhood sexual abuse, and is now overseeing 
the Secret Survivors National Initiative. Social service organizations around the 
country have participated in arts and activism training with Ping Chong + 
Company, and are now creating their own theatrical productions with survivors of 
child sexual abuse. These productions will become tools for community-based 
dialogue and action to end child sexual abuse. She holds an M.Phil in Irish 
Theatre Studies from Trinity College, Dublin and a BA from Bryn Mawr College.


